c o w?>

1.

m

1.

2.

AGENDA

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS AGENDA COMMITTEE MEETING

TUESDAY, APRIL 8, 2014, 6:30 P.M.
Room 430, Blount County Courthouse

ROLL CALL.
SETTING OF AGENDA.
PUBLIC INPUT ON ITEMS ON THE AGENDA.

APPROVAL OF AGENDA COMMITTEE MINUTES:
March 11, 2014 meeting.

ITEMS FOR CONSENT CALENDAR.
Resolutions for special recognitions.

Proclamation regarding the month of April as Child Abuse
Prevention and Awareness Month. (Tab Burkhalter)
Proclamation honoring the City of Maryville Fire Department.
(Tonya Burchfield)

Appointments:

Board of Equalization — Reappointment of Bob Ivens, Larry
Campbell, James Wilkerson, and David Weaver, and appointment
of David Caldwell. (Jerome Moon)

Sheriff's Merit Board — Harold Coulter. (Jerome Moon)

F. UNFINISHED BUSINESS.

1.

Resolution adopting and incorporating by reference the provisions of the

2012 addition of the comprehensive international building and fire codes
and the 2010 ADA standards for accessible design for the
unincorporated area of Blount County and those incorporated cities
within Blount County which have not adopted their own codes
regulating building safety and construction. (Gerald Kirby)

G. NEW BUSINESS:

HAowbnE

6.

Budget transfers.

Budget increases/decreases.

Other budget/purchasing items.

A Resolution regarding procedures for placing portraits of deceased

County Commissioners in the County Commission Meeting Room.
(Jerome Moon)

Appointment to fill the vacancy in the office of County Commissioner,

District 8 — Seat B, pursuant to T.C.A. 5-5-111. (Information only - no
action required.) (Jerome Moon)

Discussion regarding traffic patterns at the intersection of Freels Road and

Old Grey Ridge Road. (Gerald Kirby)

H. PUBLIC INPUT ON ITEMS NOT ON THE AGENDA.
l. ADJOURNMENT.



Page 1 of 5

w SOTATE OF TENNESSEE
"\ COUNTY OF BLOUNT

/ BE IT REMEMBERED that a meeting of the Agenda Committee of the Blount County Board
of Commissioners was held on Tuesday, March 11, 2014 at 6:30 pm at the courthouse in
Maryville, Tennessee.

Roll call was taken by Roy Crawford, Jr., County Clerk:

Tonya Burchfield - absent Roy Gamble - present Peggy Lambert - present
Tab Burkhalter - present Tom Greene - present Mike Lewis - absent

Rick Carver - present Brad Harrison - present Kenneth Melton - present
Mike Caylor - absent Mark Hasty - present Jerome Moon - present
Gary Farmer - present Scott Helton - absent Monika Murrell - present
Jim Folts - present Gerald Kirby - present Steve Samples - present
Ron French - present Holden Lail - present Gordon Wright - present

There were 17 present and 4 absent. Tonya Burchfield arrived after the roll was taken.
Chairman Burkhalter declared a quorum to exist. The following proceedings were held to-wit:

IN RE: SETTING OF AGENDA.

Commissioner Lambert made a motion to set the agenda. Commissioner Moon seconded the
motion.
A vote was taken on the motion:

Burchfield - absent French - yes Kirby - yes Murrell - yes
Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes Lail - yes Samples - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - yes Lewis - absent

Farmer - yes Hasty - yes Melton - yes

Folts - yes Helton - absent Moon - yes

There were 17 voting yes, 0 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 4 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared
the motion to have passed.

IN RE: MINUTES OF FEBRUARY 4, 2014 MEETING.

Commissioner Lambert made a motion to approve the minutes. Commissioner Carver seconded
the motion.
A vote was taken on the motion:

Burchfield - yes French - yes Kirby - yes Murrell - yes
Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes Lail - yes Samples - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - yes Lewis - absent

Farmer - yes Hasty - yes Melton - yes

Folts - yes Helton - absent Moon - yes

There were 18 voting yes, 0 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared
the motion to have passed.

IN RE: APPOINTMENT OF MIKE LEWIS TO THE PARKS AND RECREATION BOARD.

Commissioner Samples made a motion to send the appointment to the agenda of the March
County Commission meeting. Commissioner Hasty seconded the motion.
A vote was taken on the motion:

Burchfield - yes French - yes Kirby - yes Murrell - yes
Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes Lail - yes Samples - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - yes Lewis - absent

Farmer - yes Hasty - yes Melton - yes

Folts - yes Helton - absent Moon - yes

There were 18 voting yes, 0 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared
the motion to have passed.



Page 2 of 5

IN RE: APPOINTMENT OF CHUCK ALEXANDER, GARY HENSLEY, DAVID BLACK, AND
MATTHEW MURRAY TO THE INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENT BOARD.

Commissioner Moon made a motion to send the four names to the agenda of the March County
Commission meeting. Commissioner Carver seconded the motion.
A vote was taken on the motion:

Burchfield - yes French - yes Kirby - yes Murrell - yes
Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes Lail - yes Samples - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - yes Lewis - absent

Farmer - yes Hasty - yes Melton - yes

Folts - no Helton - absent Moon - yes

There were 17 voting yes, 1 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared
the motion to have passed.

IN RE: APPOINTMENT TO SMOKY MOUNTAIN TOURISM DEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY.

Chairman Burkhalter stated that the Board of Directors of the Smoky Mountain Tourism
Development Authority has submitted the names of Chad Rochelle, Richard Way, and Richard Maples to
fill a vacancy on the Authority.

Chairman Burkhalter asked that the members vote for a nominee:

Burchfield - Maples French - Rochelle Kirby - Way Murrell - Rochelle
Burkhalter - Rochelle Gamble - Rochelle Lail - Rochelle Samples - Rochelle
Carver - Way Greene - Rochelle Lambert - Maples Wright - Maples
Caylor - absent Harrison - Rochelle Lewis - absent

Farmer - Rochelle Hasty - Rochelle Melton - Rochelle

Folts - Rochelle Helton - absent Moon - Rochelle

There were 13 voting for Rochelle, 3 voting for Maples, and 2 voting for Way.

Commissioner Lail made a motion to send the name of Chad Rochelle to the agenda of the
March County Commission meeting. Commissioner Melton seconded the motion.

A vote was taken on the motion:

Burchfield - yes French - yes Kirby - yes Murrell - yes
Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes Lail - yes Samples - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - yes Lewis - absent

Farmer - yes Hasty - yes Melton - yes

Folts - yes Helton - absent Moon - yes

There were 18 voting yes, 0 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared
the motion to have passed.

IN RE: BUDGET TRANSFER — GENERAL COUNTY FUND - $9,100.00.

Commissioner Samples made a motion to send the item to the agenda of the March County
Commission meeting. Commissioner Lambert seconded the motion.
A vote was taken on the motion:

Burchfield - yes French - yes Kirby - yes Murrell - yes
Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes Lail - yes Samples - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - yes Lewis - absent

Farmer - yes Hasty - yes Melton - yes

Folts - yes Helton - absent Moon - yes

There were 18 voting yes, 0 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared
the motion to have passed.

IN RE: BUDGET TRANSFER — GENERAL COUNTY FUND - $6,682.64.

Commissioner Moon made a motion to send the item to the agenda of the March County
Commission meeting. Commissioner Carver seconded the motion.
A vote was taken on the motion:



Page 3 of 5

Burchfield - yes French - yes Kirby - yes Murrell - yes
Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes Lail - yes Samples - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - yes Lewis - absent

Farmer - yes Hasty - yes Melton - yes

Folts - yes Helton - absent Moon - yes

There were 18 voting yes, 0 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared
the motion to have passed.

IN RE: BUDGET TRANSFER — DEBT SERVICE FUND - $200,000.00.

Commissioner Lambert made a motion to send the item to the agenda of the March County
Commission meeting. Commissioner Greene seconded the motion.
A vote was taken on the motion:

Burchfield - yes French - yes Kirby - yes Murrell - yes
Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes Lail - yes Samples - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - yes Lewis - absent

Farmer - yes Hasty - yes Melton - yes

Folts - yes Helton - absent Moon - yes

There were 18 voting yes, 0 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared
the motion to have passed.

IN RE: RESOLUTION TO AMEND GENERAL COUNTY FUND BUDGET - $87,730.59 and
RESOLUTION TO AMEND GENERAL COUNTY FUND BUDGET - $3,000.00.

Commissioner Moon made a motion to send the items to the agenda of the March County
Commission meeting. Commissioner Carver seconded the motion.
A vote was taken on the motion:

Burchfield - yes French - yes Kirby - yes Murrell - yes
Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes Lail - yes Samples - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - yes Lewis - absent

Farmer - yes Hasty - yes Melton - yes

Folts - no Helton - absent Moon - yes

There were 17 voting yes, 1 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared
the motion to have passed.

IN RE: RESOLUTION TO AMEND GENERAL COUNTY FUND BUDGET - ($194,890.00).

Commissioner Moon made a motion to send the item to the agenda of the March County
Commission meeting. Commissioner Kirby seconded the motion.

A vote was taken on the motion:
Burchfield - yes French - yes Kirby - yes Murrell - yes

Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes Lail - yes Samples - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - yes Lewis - absent

Farmer - yes Hasty - yes Melton - yes

Folts - yes Helton - absent Moon - yes

There were 18 voting yes, 0 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared
the motion to have passed.

IN RE: RESOLUTION TO AMEND HIGHWAY FUND BUDGET - $8,599.48.

Commissioner Hasty made a motion to send the item to the agenda of the March County
Commission meeting. Commissioner Lambert seconded the motion.

A vote was taken on the motion:
Burchfield - yes Caylor - absent French - yes Harrison - yes
Burkhalter - yes Farmer - yes Gamble - yes Hasty - yes
Carver - yes Folts - yes Greene - yes Helton - absent



Page 4 of 5

Kirby - yes Lewis - absent Murrell - yes
Lail - yes Melton - yes Samples - yes
Lambert - yes Moon - yes Wright - yes

There were 18 voting yes, 0 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared
the motion to have passed.

IN RE: RESOLUTION TO AMEND GENERAL PURPOSE SCHOOL BUDGET - $3,286.00.

Commissioner French made a motion to send the item to the agenda of the March County
Commission meeting. Commissioner Kirby seconded the motion.
A vote was taken on the motion:

Burchfield - yes French - yes Kirby - yes Murrell - yes
Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes Lail - yes Samples - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - yes Lewis - absent

Farmer - yes Hasty - yes Melton - yes

Folts - yes Helton - absent Moon - yes

There were 18 voting yes, 0 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared
the motion to have passed.

IN RE: RESOLUTION DECLARING THE ATTACHED LIST OF PERSONAL PROPERTY SURPLUS
AND AVAILABLE FOR SALE ON INTERNET AUCTION.

Commissioner Moon made a motion to send the item to the consent calendar of the March
County Commission meeting. Commissioner Carver seconded the motion.
A vote was taken on the motion:

Burchfield - yes French - yes Kirby - yes Murrell - yes
Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes Lail - yes Samples - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - yes Lewis - absent

Farmer - yes Hasty - yes Melton - yes

Folts - yes Helton - absent Moon - yes

There were 18 voting yes, 0 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared
the motion to have passed.

IN RE: BLOUNT COUNTY BUDGET PROCESS CALENDAR and
HOSPITAL DEBT OBLIGATIONS.

Commissioner Lambert made a motion to send the items to the packet of the March County
Commission meeting as information only. Commissioner Gamble seconded the motion.
A vote was taken on the motion:

Burchfield - yes French - yes Kirby - yes Murrell - yes
Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes Lail - yes Samples - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - yes Lewis - absent

Farmer - yes Hasty - yes Melton - yes

Folts - yes Helton - absent Moon - yes

There were 18 voting yes, 0 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared
the motion to have passed.

IN RE: RESOLUTION ADOPTING AND INCORPORATING BY REFERENCE THE PROVISIONS OF
THE 2012 EDITION OF THE COMPREHENSIVE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING AND FIRE
CODES AND THE 2010 ADA STANDARDS FOR ACCESSIBLE DESIGN FOR THE
UNINCORPORATED AREA OF BLOUNT COUNTY AND THOSE INCORPORATED CITIES
WITHIN BLOUNT COUNTY WHICH HAVE NOT ADOPTED THEIR OWN CODES
REGULATING BUILDING SAFETY AND CONSTRUCTION.

Commissioner Kirby made a motion to send the item to the agenda of the March County
Commission meeting. Commissioner Farmer seconded the motion.



Page 5 of 5

Commissioner Samples made a motion to postpone until the April Agenda Committee meeting.

Commissioner Folts seconded the motion

A vote was taken on the motion to postpone:

Burchfield - yes French - yes
Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - no
Farmer - no Hasty - yes
Folts - yes Helton - absent

Kirby - yes Murrell - yes
Lail - yes Samples - yes
Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Lewis - absent

Melton - yes

Moon - yes

There were 16 voting yes, 2 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared

the motion to postpone to have passed.

IN RE: RESOLUTION APPOINTING ROBERT G. SIMERLY AS A JUDICIAL COMMISSIONER FOR
BLOUNT COUNTY, TENNESSEE, AND RELIEVING TANNER J. BROCK, ROBERT B.
BROWN, CHARLES SHAY COKER AND JASON HOLT OF THE DUTIES OF SAME.

Commissioner Lambert made a motion to send the item to the agenda of the March County
Commission meeting and change the wording of the third whereas to read “Whereas, the Presiding
General Sessions Judge has found it necessary to appoint, pursuant to Tennessee Code Annotated § 40-
1-111 (a) (1) (B), part time Judicial Commissioners, one (1) in number”. Commissioner Farmer seconded

the motion.

A vote was taken on the motion:
Burchfield - yes French - yes
Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - yes
Farmer - yes Hasty - yes
Folts - yes Helton - absent

Kirby - yes Murrell - yes
Lail - yes Samples - yes
Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Lewis - absent

Melton - yes

Moon - abstain

There were 17 voting yes, 0 voting no, 1 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared

the motion to have passed.

IN RE: RESOLUTION TO AMEND THE BYLAWS OF THE VETERANS AFFAIRS COMMITTEE OF

BLOUNT COUNTY, TENNESSEE.

Commissioner Lail made a motion to send the item to the agenda of the March County
Commission meeting. Commissioner Carver seconded the motion.

A vote was taken on the motion:

Burchfield - yes French - yes
Burkhalter - yes Gamble - yes
Carver - yes Greene - yes
Caylor - absent Harrison - yes
Farmer - yes Hasty - yes
Folts - yes Helton - absent

Kirby - yes Murrell - yes
Lail - yes Samples - yes
Lambert - yes Wright - yes
Lewis - absent

Melton - yes

Moon - yes

There were 18 voting yes, 0 voting no, 0 abstaining, and 3 absent. Chairman Burkhalter declared

the motion to have passed.
IN RE: ADJOURNMENT.

Chairman Burkhalter declared the meeting to be adjourned.



RESOLUTION NO. 14-04-005

SPONSORED BY: COMMISSIONERS TONYA BURCHFIELD AND
TOM GREENE

A RESOLUTION HONORING THE MARYVILLE FIRE DEPARTMENT

WHEREAS, during 2008, The Maryville Fire Department, under the leadership of
then Chief Ed Mitchell, received accreditation from the Commission on Fire
Accreditation International (CFAI); and

WHEREAS, REACCREDITATION requires that The Maryville Fire Department
complete a rigorous FIVE year process which measures and tests 186 performance
indicators; as well as a thorough evaluation of the Department’s strategic plan and
a specific Standard of Coverage which addresses the community’s risk and safety

needs and requirements; and

WHEREAS, during March, 2014, The Maryville Fire Department, under the
leadership of Safety Director Tony Crisp, Deputy Chief David Hodges, and
Accreditation Manager Captain Mike Caylor, achieved reaccreditation by CFAI,
and remains as one of the FOUR accredited Fire Departments in the State of
Tennessee, and one of 187 accredited Departments worldwide; and

WHEREAS, Blount County is proud of The Maryville Fire Department and their
determination to be the BEST of the BEST, while striving to achieve their ultimate
goal of saving lives and reducing fire losses; and

WHEREAS, Blount County is blessed to have The Maryville Fire Department and
the Department’s thirty-nine talented, devoted and professional team members
serving the citizens of our community.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Commissioners of
Blount County, Tennessee, and Blount County Mayor Ed Mitchell, assembled in
regular session on this 17" day of April, 2014, that we HEREBY: honor,
recognize and congratulate The Maryville Fire Department, not only for this
outstanding achievement, but also for their service and sacrifice to make Blount
County and the City of Maryville a wonderful and safe place to call home.



CERTIFICATION OF ACTION

Chairman
Blount County Commission

Approved:

Vetoed:

County Mayor

ATTEST

Roy Crawford
County Clerk

Date



BOARD OF EQUALIZATION

T.C.A. 67-1-401

ELECTED 2 YEARS TERMS
MEMBERS APPOINTED APRIL 19, 2012
TERMS END APRIL 19, 2014

BOB IVENS
912 W. BROADWAY
MARYVILLE, TN 37801

PETER LEQUIRE

BILL LOWE
214 WOODFIELD CIRCLE
MARYVILLE, TN 37803

LARRY CAMPBELL
4124 OLD NILES FERRY ROAD
MARYVILLE, TN 37801

JAMES C. WILKERSON
1308 WOODLAND TRACE
MARYVILLE, TN 37803

DAVID WEAVER
537 WEST HUNT ROAD
ALCOA, TN 37701

APPT. 4-19-12

APPT. 4-19-12 - RESIGNED 3/27/13

APPT. 4-19-12

APPT. 4-19-12

APPT. 4-19-12

COUNTY MAYOR APPT. 4/3/2013

CONTACT JEROME MOON, CHAIRMAN

BLOUNT COUNTY COMMISSION

865-273-5830



RESUME

LARRY CAMPBELL
4124 Old Niles Ferry Road
Maryville, Tennessee 37801
Telephone: (865) 983-1024

EMPLOYMENT HISTORY

* Employed with Attaway Electric Company in Fort Lauderdale, and Orlando,
Florida from 1967-1998

* Became Company Supervisor, overseeing all jobs and personnel in 1976

* Became Vice President of Attaway Electric Company in 1982, until July 1998
* Retired from Attaway Electric in July 1998

PROFESSIONAL PROFILE

* 1968-Obtained journeyman license in several south Florida counties

* 1981-Obtained State Contractors License in the State of Florida

* Also obtained State Licenses for Georgia, Alabama and North Carolina during my
tenure with Attaway Electric

* Served on Broward County Chapter of Florida Electrical Inspectors Board for

several years

* Served on the Board of Independent Electrical Contractors for several years

* Instrumental in the repealing of the Multiple Occupational License in the State
of Florida

JOB RESPONSBILITIES

* Was responsible for all personnel including hiring and termination of employees,
job assignments, pay raises and job performance evaluation of employees

* Prepared all bids and estimates for all jobs performed by Attaway Electric

* Prepared all contracts for jobs and for execution by the various companies, which

included but were not limited to Winn Dixie Stores, Publix Supermarkets, Port
Everglades Oil and Gasoline Terminals in several southeastern states, Texaco,
Chevron, Mobil & Exxon Gas Stations
e Worked with IBM to design wiring for computer systems for the above
companies.
* Oversaw all jobs from start to finish and was responsible for job completion
*Qversaw the wiring for alarm systems, fire systems and phone systems for our contracts.

Military Service

Honorable Discharge for service from 1961 to 1965 in the U.S. Air Force



Hobbies:

Woodworking

Fishing

Drafting plans and blueprints for homes, including my current home and my daughters
home.

After Retirement:

e InJuly of 1998, I retired and Melba and | moved to Blount County
Tennessee, where we built our present home, and supervised the
construction of my daughter’s home.

e During construction of both of these homes it became apparent that the
county did not have building codes set in place to oversee the construction
of any home in the county.

e Due to my 38 years within the construction trade, and knowing inspections
provided a degree of protection for the homebuyers to ensure that their
homes were built to a national standard of safety.

e It prompted me to address the County Commission about the need for
adoption of a standard building code. After two years of addressing this
issue, the county adopted the National Building Codes and set up a
department to make inspections of construction.

e The County Commission appointed me to serve on the Board of Zoning
Appeals in September of 2005, where | served for five years, missing
only one meeting during my term.

Larry Campbell

4124 Old Niles Ferry Rd.
Maryville, TN. 37801
Phone: 865-983-1024

Fax: 865-983-6645

E-Mail: Imtn@bellsouth.net



I moved to Blount County in 1965. My wife's Father passed away and we lived with her
Mother until 1968. Bought a house in City of Maryville , spring of 1968, and resided there
until the fall of 1980 . Moved to Peterson Lane in 1980. Built a house in Woodland Trace in
2008 and reside at this location. In 1985 bought 20 acres on Hitson Rd. During 1980's and
1990's, | bought 4 parcels on Hwy 411 South...12 acres total. Ran business there until sold
business in 2001. Sold 411 property in 2005 . Now own Hitson Rd, Peterson Lane and

Woodland Trace properties.

James C. Wilkerson.



BOB IVENS
912 WEST BROADWAY, MARYVILLE, TENNESSEE, 37801

Willing to serve on the Board of Equalization — Yes.

Resident of Blount County since childhood.

Graduate of Everett High School.

Past member on Board of Equalization.

Past President of Maryville Kiwanis and the Blount County Board of Realtors.

Started a real estate business, Ivens and Ivens Realtors, with brother, the late Ron Ivens,
many years ago.

Owner of an Office Building at 912 West Broadway, property in Fox Dale Subdivision,
and on Brookside Avenue in Blount County.



David H. Weaver
537 W Hunt Rd
Alcoa, TN 37701

David retired from the Blount County Property Assessor’s Office in 2008. He has 12 years
experience in residential and commercial appraisals and is familiar with the real estate market
and properties located in Blount County.



David Joseph Caldwell
602 Chilhowee View Rd.
Maryville, TN 37803
(865) 389-4813
bigdavell6@gmail.com
DOB: 8/9/1968

Property owner in Blount County

EDUCATION:

Maryville High School 1986

Middle Tennessee State University 1991
Sigma Chi Fraternity

EMPLOYMENT:

Owner — Vice President

Caldwell Fence Erection Company, Inc.
1102 Sevierville Rd.

PO Box 5239

Maryville, TN 37802

(865) 982-2185

COMMUNITY INVOLVEMENT:
Maryville-Alcoa Homebuilders Association
Associate of the year 1998
State Director
Home show & golf tournament chairman

Blount County Planning Commissioner

ACTIVITIES:

Member of competitive BBQ team, Bull-n-Butts, with proceeds donated to various
children’s charities

2013, 2011 Overall champion of Town Louisville BBQ Festival

2012 BBQ Bash rib champion



SHERIFF’'S MERIT BOARD

(3 YEAR TERMS)
Gary Hall 984-1737 — H (appt. 2/18/10 for 2 yrs.)
2351 Riverside Drive (reappointed 2/16/12-2/16/15)
Maryville, TN 37804
Harold Coulter 983-7668 — H (appt. 2/18/10)
207 Swanee Drive (reappointed 3/17/11-3/17/14)
Maryville, TN 37804
Danny Galyon 983-2658 — H (appt. 2/18/10 for 3 yrs.)

313 Luther Jackson Drive
Maryville, TN 37804

VACANCY

Cecil “Buster” Saffles 982-7985 — H (appt. 2/18/10 for 2 yrs.)
1936 Montvale Station Road (reappointed 2/16/12-2/16/15)
Maryville, TN 37803

CONTACT - JEROME MOON, CHAIRMAN
BLOUNT COUNTY COMMISSION
865-273-5830



HAROLD COULTER
207 Swanee Drive, Maryville, TN 37804

Harold Coulter grew up and has resided in Blount County most of his life.

He is retired from Hayes Alignment Service as the owner/operator, a company he started
in 1956.

He is also retired from Metropolitan Life Insurance Company, and worked there for 27
years.

Until just recently, he worked for several years for the Blount County Clerk’s Office.



LAW ENFORCEMENT

CIVIL SERVICE MERIT SYSTEM

PRIVATE ACTS OF 1972

CHAPTER 332

SECTION 1. All counties having a population of not less than sixty-three thousand and
seven hundred (63,700) nor more than sixty-three thousand eight hundred (63,800) inhabitants
according to U. S. Census of population of 1970 or any subsequent U. S. Census of population may
establish merit system for employees of the office of sheriff of such counties.

SECTION 2. The merit system to which this Act shall apply shall be the classified service
which includes all positions and salaried employees in the office of sheriff except the sheriff, his
chief deputy, jail cook, bookkeeper and his personal secretary, unless such secretary is deputized as
a deputy sheriff.

SECTION 3. There is hereby created a merit service board composed of five (5) members
selected by the Quarterly County Court to administer the provisions of this Act.

SECTION 4. The terms of the members shall be three (3) years; provided, however, that the
initial appointment shall be as follows:

(a) Two (2) members for one (1) year.
(b) Two (2) members for two (2) years.
(¢) One (1) member for three (3) years.

All appointments thereafter shall be for three-year terms. A member shall be eligible to
reappointment.

SECTION 5. All members of the board must be over twenty-one (21) years of age; of good
moral character; a citizen of the United States and the State of Tennessece and must reside in the
county.

SECTION 6. The members of the board shall receive such compensation as may be
determined by the Quarterly County Court.

SECTION 7. The board shall designate one of its members to serve as chairman of the
board. The sheriff shall appoint one of his employees to be personnel officer. The personnel officer
shall be the keeper of the personnel records of employees under the provisions of this Act and shall
serve as secretary of the merit service board.

132



SECTION 8. The merit service board as a body shall have the power:
(a) To adopt and amend rules and regulations for the administration of this Act.

(b) To make investigations concerning the enforcement and effect of this Act and
to require observance of the rules and regulations.

(c) To hear and determine appeals and complaints respecting the administration of
this Act.

(d) To establish and maintain a roster of all employees of the classified service in
the office of the sheriff showing their positions, rank, compensation and places of residence.

(e) To ascertain and record the duties and responsibilities pertaining to all positions
in the classified service and to classify such positions in the manner hereinafter provided.

(f) Except as otherwise provided in this Act to formulate and hold competitive tests
to determine the qualifications of persons who seek employment in any position, and as a
result of such tests, establish employment lists of eligibles for the various positions.

(g) To establish records of the performance and a system of service ratings to be used
to determine promotions, the order of lay-offs or reduction of force and the order or
re-employment to assist in the determination of dismissal for cause and for other purposes.

(h) To provide for part-time and temporary positions and appointments and to
establish rules defining and governing such positions; provided, however, that no temporary
position shall be more than three (3) months.

(1) To keep any other records as may be necessary for the administration of this Act.

SECTION 9. The board shall, as soon as practical after this Act becomes operative, adopt
a classification plan and make rules and regulations for its administration. The classification plan
shall state for each class of positions, a class title, and the duties, authorities, responsibilities and
character of work required for each position. Each class of positions may be subdivided, and classes
may be grouped and ranked in such manner as is deemed appropriate. The board shall determine the
requirements of each position and class thereof as to education, experience, capabilities, knowledge
and skill. As far as practical, the probable lines of promotion to and from the classes of position
shall be indicated.

SECTION 10. The board may, upon request and advice of the sheriff, create new positions
or combine, alter or abolish existing positions in such manner as the board, acting with the advice
of'the sheriff, deems necessary for the effective operation of the office of sheriff; provided, however,
that no position in the classified service shall be abolished except upon approval of the board acting
in good faith upon the advice of the sheriff.

133



SECTION 11. The board shall formulate reasonable rules governing the granting of leaves
of absence to members of the classified service in good standing. The board shall request the
recommendation of the sheriff upon any request of leave of absence before acting thercon and shall
be guided by the requirements of the adequate law enforcement and operational efficiency of the
office of sheriff when considering any such request for a leave.

Any person coming under the classified service who shall hereafter be inducted into the
armed forces of the United States of America, or who shall hereafter enter said service voluntarily,
by enlistment or otherwise in a time of war or other national emergency shall, upon application to
the sheriff, receive a military leave of absence for the duration of the period of service required.
Such employee shall retain all rights for seniority and shall be entitled to re-employment in the same
capacity and position which he held at the time of entering said military service. The application for
such rein-statement in position shall be made by or on behalf of such employee within three (3)
months after termination of active service in the armed forces.

SECTION 12. The sheriff shall inform the board by periodic reports of the employment
needs of the office of sheriff and the board shall, as often as required by the needs of the office of
sheriff, hold tests for the purpose of establishing lists of eligibles for the various positions in the
classified service. Such tests shall be public, competitive and open to all persons who may be
lawfully appointed under the rules promulgated by the board and existing prior to the announcement
of the examination. Such rules shall set limitations as to residence, age, health, habits, moral
character and other necessary pre-requisites for the performance of the duties of the position for
which examination is designated and such rules shall not be less than those provided in Section
38-1104 of the Tennessee Code Annotated.

Promotion tests shall be public, competitive and free to all persons examined and appointed
under the provisions of this Act and who have held a classified position with the office of sheriff for
at least one (1) year period of time. All tests shall be practical and shall consist only of subjects
which will fairly determine the capacity of the person examined to perform the duties of the position
in which the appointment is to be made. Tests may include examination for physical fitness and
manual skill. No questions in any test shall relate to religious or political opinions or affiliations.
The eligibles shall take rank upon a list which shall be compiled for each position, in the order of
their relative excellence as determined by the tests without reference to the priority of the time from
when the tests are given. No lists of eligible persons shall be valid after one (1) year except,
however, the merit service board may extend an eligible period for not more than one (1) year.
Notice of the time, place and general scope of each test and the duties, pay and experience required
for all positions for which the test is to be held, shall be given by; the board to each applicant at least
one (1) week preceding the test. The notice must be in writing and addressed to the last known
address supplied by the applicant. Notice of promotional tests shall be given as the board may
prescribe.

SECTION 13. Whenever a vacancy occurs in any position in the classified section of the
office of sheriff, the sheriff shall make requisition to the board for the names and addresses of all
persons eligible for appointment thereto. The board shall certify the names of all persons on the
eligible list for position wherein the vacancy exists within thirty (30) days of the requisition to the
board. The sheriff thereupon shall investigate each of the five (5) highest on the list of eligibles. In

134



the event the investigations result in none of the five (5) eligible persons being acceptable to the
sheriff, he shall investigate the next five (5) eligibles on the list, one after another until one of the
cligibles investigated is acceptable to the sheriff. The sheriff shall appoint such person to the
position wherein the vacancy exists and shall notify the board of his action. If the merit service
board fails to provide a list, then the sheriff may make appointments to vacancies after having
notified the board of his action or his intentions so to do.

No appointment or promotion for any position in the classified service, shall be deemed
complete until after the expiration of six (6) months probationary service during which time the
sheriff may determine the effectiveness of the employee. If in his judgment the employee does not
meet the standards, he may terminate the employment of any person certified and appointed when
he deems it to be in the best interest of the service. Whenever a position of the classified service is
filled by promotion and the services of the person promoted are terminated by the sheriff during the
probationary period, such person shall forthwith be returned to duty in the previous position held by
him in the classified service unless such person's conduct during the probationary period had given
grounds for dismissal for cause under this Act. Any person dismissed during the probationary period
shall not be eligible to a hearing before the board.

A person who is certified to the sheriff and does not report for duty at the time so designated
and who does not explain such failure to report in writing within five (5) days, may be rejected by
the sheriff who shall forthwith notify the board of the action taken and the reason therefor, and the
person's name will then be removed from the eligible list.

SECTION 14. All employees in the classified service may be transferred from one position
to another in the same class, and not otherwise. Transfers may be instituted only by the sheriff and
shall be permitted only with the consent of the sheriff.

SECTION 15. The practice and procedure of the board with respect to any investigation by
the board as authorized by this Act, shall be in accordance with the rules and regulations to be
established by the board. Such rules and regulations shall provide for a reasonable notice to all
persons affected by any order which the board may issue upon completion of such investigation.
Such persons shall have the opportunity to be heard either in person or by counsel, and to introduce
testimony in his behalf at a public hearing which shall be held for that purpose.

The board, when conducting any investigations or hearings authorized by this Act, shall have
the power to administer oaths, take depositions, issue subpoenas, compel the attendance of witnesses
and the production of books, accounts, papers, records, documents and testimony. In case of the
obedience of any person to comply with the orders of the board or of a subpoena issued by the board
or any of its members, or on the refusal of a witness to testify on any matter on which he may be
lawfully interrogated, the judge in any court of record within the county on application of any
member of the board, shall compel obedience by proceedings as for contempt. The sheriff or his
legal deputy shall serve such subpoenas as issued by the board.

SECTION 16. The sheriff shall give an immediate report in writing of all appointments,
reinstatements, vacancies, absences or other matter effecting the status of any member of the

135



classified service or the performance of the duties of such members. The report shall be in the
manner and form prescribed by the board.

The sheriff may suspend any employee for not more than ten (10) days for cause and there
shall be no right of appeal for any suspension thereof. Provided, however, the sheriff shall not have
the authority to suspend any employee for more than one suspension of ten (10) days within any
given six (6) month period of time without a right of appeal. If the sheriff shall suspend any
employee for a period longer than ten (10) days, the suspended employee shall be notified in writing
of the charges which caused his suspension. He shall thereafter have ten (10) days to request a
hearing before the merit service board, and upon his request the board shall set a hearing not more
than thirty (30) days from the date of the receipt of his request for a hearing.

SECTION 17. The sheriff shall have the authority to dismiss any employee for ordinary
cause with a right of appeal to the board assured the employee. The dismissed employee shall be
notified in writing of the causes for dismissal. He shall have ten (10) days to request a hearing
before the board and upon his request the council shall set a hearing not more than thirty (30) days
from the date of the receipt of his request. The rules of procedure for the conduct of any
investigation by the merit service board shall apply to this hearing. Upon a finding by the board that
the sheriff has not complied with the procedures of board, the board may order the employee to be
reinstated.

SECTION 18. No. employee holding a position in the classified service shall take an active
part in any political campaign while on duty nor under any circumstance shall any employee of the
office of sheriff solicit money for political campaigns or in any way use his position as a deputy
sheriff so as to reflect his personal political feelings as those of the office of sheriff or to use his
position as deputy sheriff to exert any pressure on any one person or group of people to sway that
person's or persons' political views. Neither an employee while on duty nor any officer while in
uniform shall display any political advertising or paraphernalia on his person or on his automobile.
No employee of the office of sheriff shall make any public endorsement of any candidate in any
campaign for elected office. However, nothing in this Act shall be construed to prohibit or prevent
any such employee from becoming or continuing to be a member of a political club or organization
and enjoying all the rights and privileges of such membership or from attending any political
meetings, while not on duty, or in the course of his official business, nor shall he be denied from
enjoying any freedom from interference in the casting of his vote. Any person violating the
provisions of this Section shall be dismissed from the service of the office of the sheriff.

SECTION 19. The sheriff shall not require any employee in the classified service to
participate in any political activity as a condition of employment, continuation of employment, or
promotion. If, upon an investigation by the board and its determination that such actions have taken
place, the board shall issue an order to the sheriff to cease and desist such activity. If the sheriff fails
to comply or persists in the activity, the council may apply to any court of record in the county for
a citation of contempt.

SECTION 20. If any provision of this Act or the application thereof to any person or
circumstance is held invalid, such invalidity shall not effect other provisions or applications of the

136



Act which can be given effect without the invalid provision or application, and to that end the
provision of this Act are declared to [sic] severable.

SECTION 21. All laws or parts of laws in conflict with the provisions or [sic] this Act are
hereby repealed.

SECTION 22. This Act shall become effective as to any county to which it may apply when
the same shall have been approved by the Quarterly County Court of such county by vote of not less
than two-thirds (%5) of the members thereof, such approval to be made by said Quarterly County
Court within ninety (90) days after the sine dic adjournment of the General Assembly of the State
of Tennessee for the year 1972, the public welfare requiring it becoming effective at the time. Its
approval or non-approval shall be proclaimed by the presiding officer of the Quarterly County Court
and certified by him to the Secretary of State.

SECTION 23. For the purpose of approving or rejecting the provisions of this Act, as
provided in Section 22, it shall be effective on becoming a law, the public welfare requiring it. For

all other purposes it shall become effective September 1, 1972 upon being approved as provided in
Section 22.

PASSED: March 22, 1972.

137



RESOLUTION SPONSORS: GERALD KIRBY AND GARY FARMER
RESOLUTION NO. 14-04-003

A RESOLUTION ADOPTING AND INCORPORATING BY REFERENCE THE PROVISIONS OF THE 2012 EDITION OF THE COMPREHENSIVE
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING AND FIRE CODES AND THE 2010 ADA STANDARDS FOR ACCESSIBILE DESIGN FOR THE UNINCORPORATED AREA OF
BLOUNT COUNTY AND THOSE INCORPORATED CITIES WITHIN BLOUNT COUNTY WHICH HAVE NOT ADOPTED THEIR OWN CODES REGULATING
BUILDING SAFETY AND CONSTRUCTION.

3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k ok 3k 3k 3k ok 3k 3k ok 3k 3k ok 3k 3k 3k ok 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k ok 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k ok 3k 3k 3k ok 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k ok 3k 3k 3k ok 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k ok 3k 3k ok 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k ok 3k 3k 3k ok 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k ok 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k ok 3k 3k %k 3k 3k 3k ok 3k 3k >k 3k 3k %k ok 3k >k ok 3k >k %k kk k

WHEREAS, pursuant to TENN. CODE ANN. § 5-20-101, et seq.. Blount County may adopt a resolution which incorporates by reference the
provisions of any published code containing a compilation of rules and regulations for building construction, plumbing and gas installation that
has been prepared by a technical trade association or model code organization without setting forth the provisions of such code in full:

WHEREAS, Blount County has previously adopted the 2006 editions of the comprehensive International Building and Fire codes, 2005 National
Electric Code and the 1999 North Carolina Accessibility Code for the regulation of construction within Blount County; and

WHEREAS, the codes previously adopted by Blount County are obsolete, and it is the sense of the Blount County Commission that the newest
editions of the code be adopted to stay in compliance with state regulations; and

WHEREAS, one (1) copy of the 2012 edition International Building Code (IBC), International Residential Code (IRC), International Mechanical
Code (IMC), International Plumbing Code (IPC), International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC), International Fire Code (IFC), International Energy
Conservation Code (IECC) and the 2010 ADA Standards for Accessible Design have been on file in the office of the Blount County Clerk for more
than ninety (90) days; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to TENN. CODE ANN. § 5-20-106, the IBC, IRC, IMC, IPC, IFGC, IFC, IECC and ADASAD shall apply only to the unincorporated
area of Blount County and those incorporated cities within Blount County which have not adopted their own codes regulating general building
safety and construction; and

WHEREAS, no resolution adopting and incorporating the IBC, IRC, IMC, IPC, IFGC, IFC, IECC and ADASAD may be effective until published in a
newspaper having general circulation in Blount County.

WHEREAS, the Blount County Department of Building Safety has reviewed the most current editions of the codes to be adopted herein, has
suggested amendments to these codes, which amendments are attached to this Resolution as Exhibits I-VIII.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of County Commissioners of Blount County, Tennessee, meeting in regular session assembled
this 17" day of April, 2014 as follows:



Section 1. The provisions of the following subsections (A-H) are hereby adopted and incorporated by reference for the unincorporated area of
Blount County, Tennessee and those incorporated cities within Blount County which have not adopted their own codes regulating building
safety and construction.

The 2012 International Building Code (IBC), with amendments detailed in Exhibit | of this resolution;

The 2012 International Residential Code (IRC), with amendments detailed in Exhibit Il of this resolution;

The 2012 International Mechanical Code (IMC), with amendments detailed in Exhibit IlI of this resolution;

The 2012 International Plumbing Code (IPC), with amendments detailed in Exhibit IV of this resolution;

The 2012 International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC), with amendments detailed in Exhibit V of this resolution;

The 2012 International Fire Code (IFC), with amendments detailed in Exhibit VI of this resolution;

The 2012 International Energy Conservation Code (IECC), with amendments detailed in Exhibit VII of this resolution;
The 2010 ADA Standards for Accessible Design (ADASAD), with amendments detailed in Exhibit VIII of the resolution;

IOMmMmMOO T >

Section 2. In the event that the provisions of any of these codes conflict, the building official for Blount County shall enforce the more stringent
of the conflicting provisions.

Section 3. Enforcement and violations of the adopted codes shall be governed by TENN CODE ANN. § 5-20-104 and § 5-20-105.

Section 4. The Blount County Clerk is directed to cause this resolution to be published in The Daily Times, a newspaper having a general
circulation in Blount County.

Section 5. This Resolution shall take effect upon its adoption and publication in The Daily Times, the public welfare requiring it.

ADOPTED this 17th day of April, 2014

CERTIFICATION OF ACTION ATTEST

Commission Chairman County Clerk

Approved:

Vetoed: __

County Mayor Date



Exhibit |

Amendments to the 2012 International Building Code

Section [A] 101.1 Title.

Delete “[NAME OF JURISDICTION]” and insert “Blount County, Tennessee”.

Section [A] 101.2.1 Appendices.

Insert “The following Appendices are specifically included in the adoption. All others are excluded:

Appendix A Employee Qualifications — Delete “The building official should be certified as a building official through a
recognized certification program.”

Appendix B Board of Appeals - Delete “Board of Appeals” and insert “Board of Construction Appeals”
Section [A] 101.4.3 Plumbing.

Delete “The provisions of the International Private Sewage Disposal Code shall apply to private sewage disposal systems.” Insert “Private
sewage disposal shall comply with the regulations of the Blount County Environmental Health Department.”

Section [A] 101.4.4 Property maintenance.
Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.
Section [A] 103.1 Creation of enforcement agency.

Delete this section and insert “The enforcement agency responsible for enforcement shall be the Blount County Department of Development
Services. The official in charge of enforcement shall be known as the Building Official.”

Section [A] 103.2 Appointment.

Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.

Section [A] 104.10.1 Flood hazard areas.

Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.

Section [A] 105.6 Suspension or revocation.

Insert at the end “After a permit has become void, if the owner wishes to commence construction to complete the structure for which the
original permit was issued, the Owner shall reapply for a new building permit for the completion of construction. When a new building permit
is issued, the permit fee for the completion of the construction shall be equal to the permit fee that was paid when the original permit was
issued.”

Section [A] 105.7 Placement of permit.

After the word “work”, insert “or made available to inspectors upon request”.
Section [A] 110.3.3 Lowest floor elevation.

Delete “Section 1612.5” and insert “the Blount County Floodplain Zoning Resolution”
Section [A] 110 3.7 Energy efficiency inspections.

”

Change “shall” to “may” in two places.
Section [A] 110.5 Inspection requests.

Insert “No inspections shall be performed on any jobsite or portion thereof where there is a violation of the occupational safety and health
standards for the construction industry promulgated by the Occupational Safety and Health Administration (OSHA).”



Section 1013.2 Where required.

Delete the first sentence and replace with “Guards shall be provided along open-sided walking surfaces or ground surfaces, mezzanines,
industrial equipment platforms, retaining walls, stairways, ramps, landings and any other locations that are located more than 30 inches above
the floor or grade below.”

Section 1013.8 Window sills.

Delete “36 (915 mm)” in both occurrences and insert “24 (610 mm)”.

Chapter 11 Accessibility.

Delete this chapter in its entirety including the section number and title.

Section 1203.1 General.

Add the word “(Optional)” before “Where the air infiltration rate in a dwelling unit is less than 5 air changes per hour when tested with a
blower door at a pressure 0.2 inch w.c. (50Pa) in accordance with Section 402.4.1.2 of the International Energy Conservation Code, the dwelling
unit shall be ventilated by mechanical means in accordance with Section 403 of the International Mechanical Code.”

Section 1612.3 Establishment of flood hazard areas.

Delete “[INSERT NAME OF JURISDICTION]” and insert “Blount County, Tennessee”.

Delete “[INSERT DATE OF ISSUANCE]” and insert “06/03/1991".

Section 1704.2 Special inspections.

Change the first occurrence of “shall” to “may be required to”.

Chapter 27 Electrical.

Delete this chapter in its entirety including the section number and title.

Section [P] 2901.1 Scope.

Change “International Private Sewage Disposal Code” to “requirements of the Blount County Environmental Health Department”.
Section 3401.3 Compliance.

Delete “ International Property Maintenance Code, International Private Sewage Disposal Code,”

Section 3412.2 Applicability.

Delete “[DATE TO BE INSERTED BY THE JURISDICTION. NOTE: IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT THIS DATE COINCIDE WITH THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF
BUILDING CODES WITHIN THE JURISDICITION]” and insert “the adoption of the first building code regulations in Blount County, Tennessee”.

Section 3412.3.2 Compliance with other codes.
Delete “and the International Property Maintenance Code”
Section B101.2 Membership of the board.

Delete subsection 1 in its entirety and replace with “1. Two for three years; two for two years; and one for one year.” Subsection 2, delete
“five” and insert “three”.

Section B101.2.7 Compensation of members.

Change “Compensation of members shall be determined by law.” to “Members shall not receive any compensation for their service on this
board. Members shall serve on a voluntary basis only.”



Exhibit Il

Amendments to the 2012 International Residential Code

Section R101.1 Title.
Delete ‘[NAME OF JURISDICTION]” and insert “Blount County, Tennessee”.
Section R102.5 Appendices.

Insert “The following Appendices are specifically included in the adoption. All others are excluded:

Appendix E Manufactured Housing Used as Dwellings
Appendix F Radon Control Methods

Appendix G Swimming Pools, Spas and Hot Tubs
Appendix H Patio Covers

Appendix J Existing Buildings and Structures

Section R102.7 Existing structures.
Delete “,the International Property Maintenance Code”.
Section R103.1 Creation of enforcement agency.

Delete this section and insert “The enforcement agency responsible for enforcement shall be the Blount County Department of Development
Services. The official in charge of enforcement shall be known as the Building Official.”

Section R103.2 Appointment.

Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.

Section R104.10.1 Flood hazard areas.

Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.

Section R105.6 Suspension or revocation.

Insert at the end “After a permit has become void, if the owner wishes to commence construction to complete the structure for which the
original permit was issued, the Owner shall reapply for a new building permit for the completion of construction. When a new building permit
is issued, the permit fee for the completion of the construction shall be equal to the permit fee that was paid when the original permit was
issued.”

Section R105.7 Placement of permit.

After the word “work”, insert “or made available to inspectors upon request”.

Section R109.1.2 Plumbing, mechanical, gas and electrical systems inspection.

Delete “, and prior to framing inspection.” and insert “.” after installed.

Section R109.1.4 Frame and masonry inspection.

Delete “and after the plumbing, mechanical and electrical rough-in inspections are approved.” Insert “.” after place.

Section R109.3 Inspection requests.

Insert “No inspections shall be performed on any jobsite or portion thereof where there is a violation of the occupational safety and health
standards for the construction industry promulgated by the Occupational Safety and Health Administration (OSHA).”



Table R301.2(1) Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria.
Insert “10 PSF” in the table for Ground Snow Load.

Insert “90” in the table for Wind Load.

Insert “C” in the table for Seismic Design Category.

Insert “Severe” in the table for Weathering.

Insert “10 inches” in the table for Frost Line Depth.

Insert “Moderate to Heavy” in the table for Termite.
Insert “19” in the table for Winter Design Temp.

Insert “No” in the table for Ice Barrier Underlayment Required.
Insert “210” in the table for Air Freezing Index

Insert “59.4” in the table for Mean Annual Temp.

Delete footnote h. in its entirety and in its place insert “h. Flood Hazard areas shall be as determined by the Blount County Floodplain Zoning
Resolution.”

Section R301.2.2 Seismic provisions.

Delete Item 1. in its entirety. Renumber Item 2. to Item 1. and insert “and townhouses” after the word dwellings. Insert at the end of the
section “All references to “townhouses in seismic design category C” in Chapters 6, 7 and 28 shall not apply in Blount County”.

Section R301.2.4 Floodplain construction.

Insert at the end of the paragraph “and in compliance with the regulations of the Blount County Floodplain Zoning Resolution.”

Section R302.2 Townhouses.

Delete the word “Exception:” and insert “Exception #1: For townhouses equipped with an automatic sprinkler system.” At the end of this
exception insert “Exception #2: For townhouses not equipped with an automatic sprinkler system, a common 2-hour fire-resistance-rated wall
is permitted if such walls do not contain plumbing or mechanical equipment, ducts or vents in the cavity of the common wall. Electrical
installations shall be installed in accordance with Chapters 34 through 43. Penetrations of electrical outlet boxes shall be in accordance with
Section R302.4.”

Section R302.5.1 Opening protection.

Delete the words “, equipped with a self-closing device.” and insert a period after the word “doors”.

Section R303.4 Mechanical ventilation.

Add the word “(Optional)” in the section title after the word “ventilation”. Delete the words “the dwelling unit shall be provided with whole-
house mechanical ventilation” and replace with the words “dwelling units provided with whole-house mechanical ventilation shall be”.

Section R309.3 Flood hazard areas.
Insert “3. In compliance with the regulations of the Blount County Floodplain Resolution.”
Section R309.5 Fire sprinklers.

Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.



Section R312.1.1 Where required.

Delete the first sentence and replace with “Guards shall be provided along open-sided walking surfaces or ground surfaces, mezzanines,
industrial equipment platforms, retaining walls, stairways, ramps, landings and any other locations that are located more than 30 inches above
the floor or grade below.”

Section R312.2 Window fall protection.

Delete this section and subsection in their entirety including the section number and title.

Section R313.1 Townhouse automatic sprinkler systems.

Insert the words “(Optional, see TENN. CODE ANN. § 68-120-101 (a) (8))” in the section title after the word “Systems” and by deleting the words
“An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed in townhouses.” and replace with “When an automatic residential sprinkler
system is installed in townhouses, the following shall apply:”

Section R313.2 One- and two- family dwellings automatic fire systems.

Insert the words “(Optional, see TENN. CODE ANN. § 68-120-101 (a) (8))” in the section title after the word “systems” and by deleting the words
“An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed in one- and two-family dwellings.” and replace with “When an automatic
residential sprinkler system is installed in one- and two-family dwellings, the automatic residential sprinkler system shall be designed and
installed in accordance with Section R313.2.1.”

Section R314.2 Smoke detection systems.

Insert “manufacturer’s instructions and” after “installed in accordance with the.....".

Section R322.1.7 Protection of water supply and sanitary sewage systems.

Delete “Chapter 3 of the International Private Sewage Disposal Code” and insert “the requirements of the water and sewer service utility
providers and the Blount County Environmental Health Department”.

Section R401.4.1 Geotechnical evaluation.

Insert the words “and all footings shall have a minimum of two runs of No. 4 bar in the middle third of the footing depth” after the word
“assumed”.

Section R501.3 Fire protection of floors.
Insert the word “Optional” at the end of the word “floors” in the section title.
Section R502.11.4 Truss design drawings.

Delete “shall be submitted to the building official and approved prior to installation” and insert “shall be provided at the framing inspection
when required by the building official or onsite inspector”.

Section R802.10.1 Truss design drawings.

Delete “shall be provided to the building official and approved prior to installation” and insert “shall be provided at the framing inspection
when required by the building official or onsite inspector”.

Table N1102.1.1 (R402.1.1) Insulation and fenestration requirements by component.

In the row for Climate Zone “4 except Marine”, change Ceiling R-Value from “49” to “38”, Wood Frame Wall from “20 or 13 + 5” to “13” and
Mass Wall R-Value from “8/13” to “5/10”.

Table N1102.1.3 (R402.1.3) Equivalent U-Factors.

In the row for Climate Zone “4 except Marine”, change Ceiling U-Factor from “0.026” to “0.030”, Frame Wall U-Factor from “0.057” to “0.082"
and Mass Wall U-Factor from “0.098” to “0.141".

Section N1102.2.6 (R402.2.6) Steel-frame ceilings, walls, and floors.

Delete the words “Table N1102.2.6” and insert “Table N1102.1.1 (R402.1.1)".



Section N1102.4.1.2 (R402.4.1.2) Testing.

Insert the word “(Optional)” after the word “Testing” in the section title and insert “Where required by the building official,” before the first
sentence and change the word “The” to “the”.

Section N1103.1.1 (R403.1.1) Programmable thermostat.

Insert the word “(Optional)” after the word “thermostat” in the section title and insert “Where required by the building official and” before the
first sentence and change the word “Where” to “where”.

Section N1103.2.2 (R403.2.2) Sealing (Mandatory).

Insert “Where required by the building official,” before the words “Duct tightness” and change the word “Duct” to “duct”.
Section G2413 (402) Pipe Sizing.

Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.

Section G2428 (504) Sizing of Category | Appliance Venting Systems.

Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.

Section P2603.5.1 Sewer depth.

Delete “[NUMBER]” in two places and insert “twelve (12)”.

Section P2904 Dwelling Unit Fire Sprinkler Systems.

Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.

Chapters 34-40 General Requirements, Services, Branch Circuit and Feeder Requirements, Power and Lighting Distribution and Devices and
Luminaries.

Delete these chapters in their entirety including the section number and title.

Section AE304.2 Plan review fees.

Delete “at the time of submitting plans and specifications for review”.

Section AE304.3.2.1 Investigation.

Delete the word “shall” and replace with the word “may”.

Section AE304.3.2.2 Fee.

Delete the word “shall” and replace with the word “may” in the first three places it occurs.

Section AE305.5 Required inspections.

Add a new section before Section AE305.5.1 as follows:

“AE305.5.0 Mobile home inspection exemption. The inspections required by this section shall not apply to mobile homes as exempted by the
State of Tennessee but shall apply to any construction or installation of decks, porches, steps or other structures or equipment. All mobile
homes shall pass a final inspection and have a certificate of occupancy issued.”

Section AF101.1 General.

Add a third paragraph as follows:

“Buildings in locations where testing has verified the radon potential to be less than 4pCi/L shall be exempt from the requirements of this
appendix. Written test reports from a qualified testing agency shall be required to be submitted for verification.”



Exhibit Il

Amendments of the 2012 International Mechanical Code

Section 101.1 Title.

Delete ‘[NAME OF JURISDICTION]' and insert “Blount County, Tennessee”

Section 101.2.1 Appendices.

Delete all previously adopted appendices.

Section 103.1 General.

Insert “This department shall be known as the Blount County Department of Building Safety.”
Section 103.2 Appointment.

Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.

Section 106.5.2 Fee schedule.

Delete “[JURISDICTION TO INSERT APPROPRIATE SCHEDULE]” and insert “Fee schedule to be adopted by Blount County Commission by
Resolution.”

Section 106.5.3 Fee refunds.

Delete this section in its entirety, including the section number and title.

Section 107.2 Required inspections and testing.

At the end of the first paragraph insert “No inspections shall be performed on any jobsite or portion thereof where there is an unsafe condition
or violation of the occupational safety and health standards for the construction industry promulgated by the Occupational Safety and Health
Administration (OSHA).”

Section 108.4 Violation penalties.

Delete “guilty of a [SPECIFY OFFENSE], punishable by a fine of not more than [AMOUNT] dollars or by imprisonment not exceeding [NUMBER OF
DAYS], or both such fine and imprisonment” and insert “subject to penalties as prescribed by law”.

Section 108.5 Stop work orders.

Delete “liable for a fine of not less than [AMOUNT] dollars or more than [AMOUNT] dollars” and insert “subject to penalties as prescribed by
law”.

Section 109 Means of Appeal.

Delete Section 109 in its entirety and insert “The Board of Construction Appeals shall be as established and regulated by the 2012 International
Building Code.”

Section 312 Heating and Cooling Load Calculations.

Insert at the end of the paragraph “All load calculations will be the responsibility of the Mechanical Contractor or Engineer of Record and shall
be supplied if required by the building official.”

Section 401.2 Ventilation required.
Add the word “Optional” before “Where the air infiltration rate in a dwelling unit is less than 5 air changes per hour when tested with a blower

door at a pressure of 0.2-inch water column (50 Pa) in accordance with Section 402.4.1.2 of the International Energy Conservation Code, the
dwelling unit shall be ventilated by mechanical means in accordance with Section 403.”



Exhibit IV

Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code

Section [A] 101.1 Title.

Delete ‘[NAME OF JURISDICTION]' and insert “Blount County, Tennessee”
Section [A] 103.2 Appointment.

Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.
Section [A] 106.6.2 Fee Schedule.

Delete “[JURISDICTION TO INSERT APPROPRIATE SCHEDULE]” and insert “Fee schedule to be adopted by Blount County Commission by
Resolution.”

Section [A] 106.6.3 Fee refunds.

Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.

Section [A] 107.2 Required inspections and testing.

At the end of the first paragraph insert “No inspections shall be performed on any jobsite or portion thereof where there is an unsafe condition
or violation of the occupational safety and health standards for the construction industry promulgated by the Occupational Safety and Health
Administration (OSHA).”

Section [A] 108.4 Violation penalties.

Delete “guilty of a [SPECIFY OFFENSE], punishable by a fine of not more than [AMOUNT] dollars or by imprisonment not exceeding [NUMBER OF
DAYS], or both such fine and imprisonment” and insert “subject to penalties as prescribed by law”.

Section [A] 108.5 Stop work orders.

Delete “liable for a fine of not less than [AMOUNT] dollars or more than [AMOUNT] dollars” and insert “subject to penalties as prescribed by

”

law”.
Section 109 Means of Appeal.

Delete Section 109 in its entirety and insert “The Board of Construction Appeals shall be as established and regulated by the 2012 International
Building Code.”

Chapter 12 Special Piping and Storage Systems.
Delete this chapter in its entirety including the chapter number and title.
Chapter 13 Gray Water Recycling Systems.

Delete this chapter in its entirety including the chapter number and title.



Exhibit V

Amendments to the 2012 International Fuel Gas Code

Section [A] 101.1 Title.

Delete ‘[NAME OF JURISDICTION]’ and insert “Blount County, Tennessee”

Section [A] 103.1 General.

Insert “This department shall be known as the Blount County Department of Building Safety.”
Section [A] 103.2 Appointment.

Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.

Section [A] 106.6.2 Fee Schedule.

Delete “[JURISDICTION TO INSERT APPROPRIATE SCHEDULE]” and insert “Fee schedule to be adopted by Blount County Commission by
Resolution.”

Section [A] 106.6.3 Fee refunds.
Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.
Section [A] 108.4 Violation penalties.

Delete “guilty of a [SPECIFY OFFENSE], punishable by a fine of not more than [AMOUNT] dollars or by imprisonment not exceeding [NUMBER OF
DAYS], or both such fine and imprisonment” and insert “subject to penalties as prescribed by law”.

Section [A] 107.2 Required inspections and testing.

At the end of the first paragraph insert “No inspections shall be performed on any jobsite or portion thereof where there is an unsafe condition
or violation of the occupational safety and health standards for the construction industry promulgated by the Occupational Safety and Health
Administration (OSHA).”

Section [A] 108.5 Stop work orders.

Delete “liable for a fine of not less than [AMOUNT] dollars or more than [AMOUNT] dollars” and insert “subject to penalties as prescribed by

”

law”.
Section 109 Means of Appeal.

Delete Section 109 in its entirety and insert “The Board of Construction Appeals shall be as established and regulated by the 2012 International
Building Code.”



Exhibit VI

Amendments to the 2012 International Fire Code

Section [A] 101.1 Title.

Delete ‘[NAME OF JURISDICTION]’ and insert “Blount County, Tennessee”.

Section 103 Department of Fire Prevention.

Delete “Department of” reading only “Fire Prevention”.

Section [A] 103.1 General.

Delete this section in its entirety and insert “The Blount County Department of Building Safety shall assume all functions and duties necessary
to enforce the adopted provisions of this code under the direction of the Building Official. The fire code official as referenced throughout this
code shall be changed to read Building Official.”

Section [A] 103.2 Appointment.

Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.

Section [A] 105.1.2 Types of permits.

Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.

Section [A] 105.6 Required operational permits.

Delete this section in its entirety including the section number and title.

Section [A] 106.1 Inspection authority.

At the end of the first paragraph insert “No inspections shall be performed on any jobsite or portion thereof where there is an unsafe condition
or violation of the occupational safety and health standards for the construction industry promulgated by the Occupational Safety and Health
Administration (OSHA).”

Section 108 Board of Appeals.

Delete Section 108 in its entirety and insert “The Board of Construction Appeals shall be as established and regulated by the 2012 International
Building Code.”

Section [A] 109.4 Violation penalties.

Delete “guilty of a [SPECIFY OFFENSE], punishable by a fine of not more than [AMOUNT] dollars or by imprisonment not exceeding [NUMBER OF
DAYS], or both such fine and imprisonment” and insert “subject to penalties as prescribed by law”.

Section 111.4 Failure to comply.

Delete ‘liable for a fine of not less than [AMOUNT] dollars or more than [AMOUNT] dollars” and insert ‘subject to penalties as prescribed by

”

law”.



Exhibit VII

Amendments to the 2012 International Energy Conservation Code

Section C101.1 Title.
Delete “[NAME OF JURISDICTION]” and insert “Blount County, Tennessee”.
Section C101.5 Compliance.

Delete the first sentence in its entirety and insert “Residential buildings shall meet the provisions of IECC-Residential Provisions, or Chapter 11,
Energy Efficiency, of the International Residential Code for One and Two Family Dwellings, 2012 edition.”

Section C108.4 Failure to comply.

Delete “liable for a fine of not less than [AMOUNT] dollars or more than [AMOUNT] dollars” and insert “subject to penalties as prescribed by

”

law”.
Section €109 Board of Appeals.

Delete Section C109 in its entirety and insert “The Board of Construction Appeals shall be as established and regulated by the 2012
International Building Code.”

Section C402.2.6 Slabs on grade.

Insert the word “(Optional)” after the word “grade” in the section title. Insert “Due to local termite infestation vulnerability conditions, the
slab-on-grade floor perimeter insulation required by this section shall be optional in Blount County. Should said insulation be provided, the
insulation shall comply with this section.” before the word “Where” in the first sentence.

Section C402.4.1.2.3 Building test.

Insert the word “(Optional)” after the word “test” in the section title. Delete “The completed building shall be tested and the air leakage rate of
the building envelope” and insert “The air leakage rate of the building envelope for completed buildings that are tested”.

Section R101.1 Title.
Delete ‘[NAME OF JURISDICTION]' and insert “Blount County, Tennessee”
Section R101.5 Compliance.

Delete the first sentence in its entirety and insert “Residential buildings shall meet the provisions of IECC-Residential Provisions, or Chapter 11,
Energy Efficiency, of the International Residential Code for One and Two Family Dwellings, 2012 edition.”

Section R108.4 Failure to comply.

Delete “liable for a fine of not less than [AMOUNT] dollars or more than [AMOUNT] dollars” and insert “subject to penalties as prescribed by

”

law”.
Section R109 Board of Appeals.

Delete Section R109 in its entirety and insert “The Board of Construction Appeals shall be as established and regulated by the 2012
International Building Code.”

Table R402.1.1 Insulation and fenestration requirements by component.

In the row for Climate Zone “4 except Marine”, change Ceiling R-Value from “49” to “38”, Wood Frame Wall from “20 or 13 + 5” to “13” and
Mass Wall R-Value from “8/13” to “5/10”.

Table R402.1.3 Equivalent U-Factors.

In the row for Climate Zone “4 except Marine”, change Ceiling U-Factor from “0.026” to “0.030”, Frame Wall U-Factor from “0.057” to “0.082"
and Mass Wall U-Factor from “0.098” to “0.141".



Section R402.4.1.2 Testing.

Insert the word “(Optional)” after the word “Testing” in the section title and insert “Where required by the building official,” before the first
sentence and change the word “The” to “the”.

Section R402.2.9 Slabs on grade.

Insert the word “(Optional)” after the word “grade” in the section title. Insert “Due to local termite infestation vulnerability conditions, the
slab-on-grade floor perimeter insulation required by this section shall be optional in Blount County. Should said insulation be provided, the
insulation shall comply with this section.” before the word “Where” in the first sentence.

Section R403.1.1 Programmable thermostat.

Insert the word “(Optional)” after the word “thermostat” in the section title and insert “Where required by the building official and” before the
first sentence and change the word “Where” to “where”.

Section R403.2.2 Sealing (Mandatory).

Insert “Where required by the building official,” before the words “Duct tightness” and change the word “Duct” to “duct”.



Exhibit VIII

Amendments to the 2010 ADA Standards for Accessible Design

These standards will be adopted in their entirety.



ICC

Blount County Government

Department of Building Safety
1221 McArthur Rd, Maryville, Tennessee 37804
Phone: 865-681-9301 / Fax: 865- 681-9502

INTERNATIONAL
CODE COUNCIE®

Date: March 24, 2014
To: Blount County Commissioners

From: Marty Yates
Building Official
Blount County Department of Building Safety
1221 McArthur Rd
Maryville, TN 37804

Subject: Changes Transitioning from the 2006 to the 2012 International Codes

Blount County Commissioners:

Attached you will find a copy of an overview containing changes that will take place if the county transitions
from the 2006 International Codes to the 2012 International Codes. This overview was compiled after a
page by page comparison of the two codes. To the best of my ability, it contains those items that will create
the biggest change for contractors or homeowners.

Our department worked with the City of Maryville and City of Alcoa over a period of a year to reflect the
changes that would keep the code as uniform as possible from jurisdiction to jurisdiction. The consensus
was to try and keep the code consistent for those individuals building in all jurisdictions.

The overview contains an explanation of what each amendment in the resolution represents under each

separate code and then tries to present the changes based on those amendments. If there are any questions
that I can clear up, please feel free to call me at your convenience.

Marty Yates

m ﬂ%t/,/Z/ @{\v

Blount County Department of Building Safety



Overview of Changes Transitioning from
the 2006 to the 2012 International Codes

Under T.C.A. Section 68-120-1019(b)(4), local government’s building construction safety
code publications must be current within seven(7) years of the date of the latest editions in
publication. Surrounding jurisdictions, (i.e. City of Maryville, City of Alcoa, City of Knoxville and
Knox County) have already updated to the 2012 codes. It would be important to stay on the
same code cycle as these surrounding jurisdictions so that building codes stay as close to
uniform as possible from county to county.

To begin, the county presently has adopted for the regulation of commercial
construction the International Building Code (IBC), International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC),
International Plumbing Code (IPC), International Mechanical Code (IMC), International Energy
Conservation Code (IECC), the International Fire Code (IFC) and the 1999 North Carolina
Accessibility Code (NCAC). These will be taken individually to attempt to provide information
on any significant changes. Most of any changes will be addressed by the architect or engineer
of record during the planning process and should not cause a significant issue.

2012 International Building Code:

Amendments of the resolution reflected in Sections 101.1-110.5, 1612.3, 1704.2,
2901.1, 3401.3, 3412.2, 3412.3.2 are housekeeping type changes that are required to properly
name sections specific to Blount County. Also, these sections remove items that conflict with
the duties of the building codes department. For instance, transferring septic responsibility to
Environmental Health, deleting reference to the enforcement of the Property Maintenance
Code and transferring all flood hazard area responsibility to the Floodplain Zoning Resolution
enforced by the Building Commissioner.

Amendments in Sections 1013.2-1013.8 change the code back to read what is presently
enforced in the 2006 version.

Chapter 11 on Accessibility is being deleted in order to conform to what the state has
adopted for commercial construction. That is the 2010 ADA Standards for Accessible Design.

The Amendment in Section 1203.1 gives flexibility in blower door testing by allowing it
to be optional and not a requirement. The 2012 IBC requires that dwelling units be tested for
air leakage.

Chapter 27 on Electrical is being deleted based on a recommendation of the County
Attorney. Due to the state having jurisdiction, the county is not responsible for enforcement of
the electrical code.

Amendments in Sections B101.2 and B101.2.7 reflect changes that are needed to
continue the Board of Construction Appeals as established.



The most significant change in the IBC is located in Section 310.5.1 and deals with
individuals wanting to put an adult or child day care in their home. Presently, the code allows
up to sixteen (16) people in a single family dwelling without having to provide a sprinkler
system. The 2012 code drops this number to five (5). So anyone wishing to care for more than
five (5) persons in a residential home would be required to sprinkle it.

2012 International Fuel Gas Code:

All amendments of the resolution reflect housekeeping measures as stated above. After
comparing the 2006 and 2012 code, there appears to be no changes that will create a
significant increase in construction cost from a commercial standpoint. As stated above, the
architect or engineer will address any requirements in the building plans.

2012 International Plumbing Code:

Amendments of the resolution in Sections 101.6-109 reflect housekeeping measures as
stated above.

Chapter 12 and Chapter 13 are being removed to better reflect what is presently
adopted. These sections are not contained in the 2006 codes.

The most significant change in the IPC is located in Section 312 and no longer allows air
testing on plastic drain lines. This is due in part to the danger involved with airing the system
up over the required test pressure. However, this also could possibly create another problem
during winter months with freezing temperatures. Therefore, the enforcement of this
requirement will be weather specific so as not to create a bigger problem with frozen pipes.

2012 International Mechanical Code:

Amendments of the resolution in Sections 101.1-109 reflect housekeeping measures as
stated above.

Section 312 is being amended to put the responsibility of calculating heating and air
loads on the mechanical contractor or engineer of record.

Section 401.2 again addresses the requirement for blower door testing and amends the
code to make the requirement optional as amended in the IBC.

There appears to be no more significant differences between the 2006 and 2012 code.

2012 International Energy Conservation Code:

The resolution contains amendments relating to both commercial and residential
construction. This is because the 2012 IECC contains sections for both. The changes discussed
here will only relate to commercial construction. Residential changes will be discussed later in
the residential code section.



Amendments of the resolution in Sections C101.1-C109 reflect housekeeping measures
as stated above.

Section C402.2.6 is amended to allow perimeter concrete slab insulation to be optional.
The 2012 code requires concrete slabs to be insulated around the perimeter for energy
conservation. In our area, termite infestation is moderate to high. Termites are attracted to
the insulation used in these applications. Therefore, the code is amended to make this
requirement optional.

Section 402.4.1.2.3 again addresses the requirement for air leakage testing and amends
the code to make the requirement optional.

The largest and most significant changes between the 2006 and 2012 codes occur in the
IECC, both commercial and residential. With respect to commercial, insulation values increase
significantly. For instance, exterior wall insulation for wood framed commercial buildings
increases from R-13 to R-20. Attic insulation increases from R-30 to R-38. Again, these changes
will be reflected in the drawings submitted by the architect or engineer related to the project.

Another significant change is reflected in the requirement for more efficient light bulbs
used in electrical fixtures. The code requires at least 75% of the bulbs used be high efficacy.
This requirement will be difficult to enforce.

2012 International Fire Code:

Amendments of the resolution in Sections [A]101.1-103.2 reflect housekeeping
measures as stated above.

Sections [A]105.1.2 and [A]105.6 delete required permits for operations such as,
welding, crop ripening, fumigation, open flames in churches, etc. This is due in part to the
manpower needed to police such operations.

The remaining sections in the resolution address further housekeeping type measures.

After comparing the 2006 and 2012 code, it appears there are no significant changes
that will be different than what is being enforced at the present time. Again, any small
differences will be addressed by the architect or engineer on the specific project.

2010 ADA Standards for Accessible Design:

These standards are replacing the present code the county has adopted, which is
obsolete. The standards are what the state has adopted for accessibility and would be the
minimum requirements that would have to be enforced on commercial construction in the
county. There are no specific changes between these standards and what is presently adopted
that would cause significant issues during construction. The standards still give general
requirements for designing a building to allow someone who is disabled the ability to access all
necessary areas.



The county has adopted for the regulation of residential construction the 2006
International Residential Code. Residential construction makes up the largest amount of
inspections that are completed on a yearly basis. It stands to reason that any significant
changes in the requirements would create a huge impact on contractors, as well as,
homeowners. Therefore, the following is an attempt to provide information on those changes.

2012 International Residential Code:

Amendments of the resolution in Sections R101.1-Table R301.2(1) contain housekeeping
measures as stated above.

Section R301.2.2 is amended so that townhouses built in our seismic zone are not
required to meet the seismic provisions of the code. This keeps the requirements as they are
presently adopted.

Section R302.2 amends the code back to what is presently adopted. Townhouses with
sprinklers would be exempt from this section and those without sprinklers would have to have
a 2 hour separation wall.

Section R302.5.1 deletes the requirement that doors from the garage into the house
have self closing devices.

Section R303.4 makes the requirement for whole house ventilation optional when the
blower door test does not meet specific requirements.

Section R309.5 deletes the requirement for residential sprinkler systems in private
garages based on separation distance of exterior walls.

Section R312.1.1 amends the code back to read as it is adopted now with respect to
guards around walking surfaces thirty (30) inches above grade.

Section R312.2 deletes a section that requires opening limiters on windows within
sleeping areas. It is the opinion of the surrounding jurisdictions that it creates a safety hazard
during an emergency.

Sections R313.1 and R313.2 are amended to make the requirement for sprinkler
systems in townhouses and residential homes optional based on T.C.A. § 68-120-101 (a)(8).

Sections R314.2 and R322.1.7 contain housekeeping measures.

Section R401.4.1 is amended to include the requirement for two (2) runs of number 4
rebar throughout all concrete footings within Blount County. This is based on the soil types
located within the county.

Section R501.3 amends the requirement that floor systems in crawlspaces and
basements used for storage be protected underneath with sheetrock to be optional.



Amendments of the resolution in Sections R502.11.4 and R802.10.1 contain
housekeeping measures as stated above.

Table N1102.1.1, N1102.1.3 and Section N1102.2.6 amends the code back to what is
presently adopted with respect to insulation values.

Sections N1102.4.1.2, N1103.1.1 and N1103.2.2 are amended to make optional the
requirements for blower door testing, programmable thermostat and duct leakage testing.

Sections G2413 and G2428 delete the requirement for sizing of fuel gas pipe and vent
pipe for gas appliances. This is typically regulated by the service provider.

Chapters 34-40 address electrical enforcement and have been deleted. The state has
responsibility for the enforcement of electrical codes.

Remaining amendments to the resolution, again, reflect housekeeping measures.

The first significant change that is reflected in the 2012 IRC is the requirement for
carbon monoxide detectors located outside sleeping areas in dwellings that contain fuel-fired
appliances and dwellings that have an attached garage.

The next change requires that all shingle roofs now contain drip edge at the gables and
eaves.

The next change requires that all concrete footings contain a minimum of two (2) runs
of number 4 rebar throughout, as mentioned above in the resolution.

The next change requires that foundation drain tiles and foundation
waterproofing/damp proofing will now be enforced on any concrete or masonry foundation
that retains earth and encloses interior spaces and floors below grade.

As mentioned above in the IPC, plastic drain lines can no longer be tested with air.
Again, this will be enforced based on weather conditions at the time of the test.

Headers and corners are now required to be insulated. Additional sealing to prevent air
infiltration is also required.

Clothes dryer exhaust lengths have changed from a maximum of 25 feet to 35 feet.
Egress windows are now required in bonus rooms above garages.

Finally, decks will be attached to a structure based on Section R507. This section gives
specific direction on the attachment of the ledger board that is not contained in the 2006
codes.



Blount County Department of Building Safety
New Code Changes eom—

aniﬁéant changes transitioning to the 2012 International Residential Code

1. Handrails are required on at least one side of steps with four risers or more (Section R311.7.8).
Carbon monoxide detectors are now required outside each separate sleeping area in the immediate
vicinity of the bedrooms in dwelling units within which fuel-fired appliances are installed and in
dwelling units that have attached garages (Section R315).

3. Foundation drain tiles and foundation waterproofing/damp proofing will now be enforced on
any concrete or masonry foundation that retains carth and encloses interior spaces and floors below
grade (Section R405 and Section R406).

4. Deck attachment to the structure will be based on the new section in the code book (Section R507,

see attached handout).

Drip edge is now required at the eaves and gables of shingle roofs (Section R905.2.8.5).

Protection from impact is required for all appliances located in an area where they are subject to

impact from a vehicle (Section M1307.3.1, see attached handout).

7. Clothes dryer exhaust duct specified length has increased to 35 feet (Section M1502.4.4.1).
When fittings are used, the maximum length shall be reduced according to the table attached (Table
M1502.4.4.1).

AN




. R506.2.4 Reinforcement support. Where provided in slabs
* on ground, reinforcement shall be supported to remain in
- . place from the center to upper one third of the slab for the
= duration of the concrete placement.

| #The code does not require reinforcement for the con-
crete slab-on-ground floors. When reinforcement is
provided, common practice is to use welded wire fab-
ric. The welded wire fabric frequently is left on the
ground during the pour and not picked up. When
lifted up by construction personnel, it is often not in a
proper or consistent location, with some on the
ground and some near the top of the slab. This sec-
tion does not require instailation of reinforcement;
however, if it is installed, it must be properly located
in the slab, or its benefit is lost.

SECTION R507
DECKS

i R307.1 Decks. Where supported by attachment to an exterior
-wall. decks shall be positively anchored to the primary struc-
- twre and designed for both vertical and lateral loads. Such
- utachment shall not be accomplished by the use of toenails or
- nails subject to withdrawal. Where positive connection to the
- primary building structure cannot be verified during inspec-
«tion. decks shall be self-supporting. For decks with cantile-
red framing members, connections to exterior walls or
“other framing members, shall be designed and constructed to
“resist uplift resulting from the full live load specified in Table
R301.5 acting on the cantilevered portion of the deck.

+%lf an exterior wall is used to support a deck, the deck
~ framing must be positively attached to the building
- structure. This connection design must include a con-

i

FLOORS

sideration of both vertical and lateral loads, and the
connection must be available for inspection. If it is
not, this method of support is not permitted and the
deck must be self-supporting.

If a deck has cantilevered framing, the framing
must have a connection to its support that is
designed to resist any uplift resulting from the full live
load acting on the cantilevered span only. This load
condition will produce maximum uplift at the support
opposite the cantilevered end.

R56G7.2 Deck ledger connection to band joist. For decks
supporting a total design load of 50 pounds per square foot
(2394 Pa) [40 pounds per square foot {1915 Pa) live load plus
10 pounds per square foot {479 Pa) dead load], the connection
between a deck ledger of pressure-preservative-treated
Southern Pine, incised pressure-preservative-treated Hem-Fir
or approved decay-resistant species, and a Z-inch (51 mm)
nominal lumber band joist bearing on a sill plate or wall plate
shall be constructed with 1lz-inch (127 mm) lag screws or
bolts with washers in accordance with Table R507.2. Lag
screws, bolts and washers shall be hot-dipped galvanized or
stainless steel.

< This section contains the prescriptive design for posi-
tive anchorage of a deck attached to the primary struc-
ture. The design is for vertical loads only [50 psf (2394
Pa) maximum] on the deck.

Researchers at Virginia Tech University and Wash-
ington State University have tested simulated deck-
ledger to house-band-joist connectionsin their respec-
tive laboratories. A practical range of pressure-preser-
vative-treated (PPT) deck ledger lumber (incised
Hem-Fir and Southern Pine) was attached fo a simu-
lated Spruce-Pine-Fir band joist by "/,-inch (12.7 mm)
lag screws or bolts with washers. The ledger connec-

TABLE R507.2 _
FASTENER SPACING FOR A SOUTHERN PINE OR HEM-FIR DECK LEDGER AND
A 2-INCH-MOMINAL SOLID-SAWN SPRUCE-PINE-FIR BAND JOIST®"9
(Deck live load = 40 psf, deck dead load = 10 psf)

JOIST SPAN

Connection details

6 and less [ 617108 | 817t 10’ { 101" to 127

~1l.inch diameter lag screw with "/, inch
wsimum sheathing®

i inch diameter bolt with '/, inch maximun
ieathing

Linch diameter bolt with '/, inch maximum
heathing and '/, inch stacked washers™"

4
2
s
5
i

feactice,

: ;:2012!NTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE® COMMENTARY

a SI: | inch = 25.4 mum, | foot = 304.8 mm. 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa.
2 The tip of the lag screw shall [ully extend beyond the inside face of the band joist.
b The masimum gap between the face of the ledger board and face of the wall sheathing shall be '/, inch.
«. Ledgers shall be 1lashed Lo prevent water from contacting the house band joist.

Lug serews and bolts shall be staggered in accordance with Seetion R507.2.1.

121" t014" | 1417"1016" | 161710 18
On-center épacing of fasteners®*®
13 l 11 10
24 J 21 19
21 }‘ 18 16
i ]

Deck ledger shall be minimum 2 x § pressure-preservative-treated No. 2 grade lumber, or other approved materials as established by standard engineering

When solid-sawn pressure-preservative-treated deck ledgers are attached to a minimum }-inch-thick engineered wood product (structural composite lumber,
hminated vencer lumber or wood structural panc! band joist), the ledger attachment shall be designed in accerdance with accepted engineering practice.
1 Aminimum 1 x 9'/, Douglas Fir laminated veneer lumber rimboard shal! be permitted in lieu of the 2-inch nominat band joist.

fif."d‘-'omi structural panel sheathing, gypsum board sheathing or fvam sheathing not exceeding 1 inch in thickness shall be permitted. The maximum distance
" keween the face of the ledger board and the face of the band joist shall be 1 inch

»See the commentary to Sections R507.2 and R507.2.1.

5-55

DECKS

. SECTION R507

FASTENER
SCHED

[

WAL
BRACING
|
STEEL
WALL
FRMG

. VAS(
| wALL
|—

CON
WAL



7l-gl

AHVINIANNWOD ,3A00 TVILNIAISIH TYNOILYNHILNI 210

N

!

\

’ BARRIER LOCATIONS WHEN APPLIANCES ARE IN THE NORMAL PATH OF

VEHICLES i

-

— 5 —
|
|
!
I
!
!
|

OPTION 2: WHEEL —
BARRIER

For SI: 1inch =254 mm.

—

FURNACE

TE FURNAcm N FURNACE

”///4 \\\\

T,
fWATER 3 A
@EATER&

(24

FOR
APPLIANCES
OUT OF THE

NORMAL
PATH OF
THE
VEHICLES,

THIS
BOLLARD IS

OPTIONAL

Figure M1307.3.1

<
A
0
(€

MINIMUNM 27 SCH. 40 IRON PIPE

PIPE BOLLARD
(OPTION 1)

FILLED WITH CONCRETE

HEIGHT 36" MINIMUM \

A

WHEEL BARRIER
(OPTION 2)

f .
(OPTION 3) 61g "
FOR RETRO INSTALLATION l
‘.——«—

2" DIA. MIN,

STEEL SCH. 40 PIPE
ORTUBE

¥" STEEL
PLATE

e

Ve X 2% STUD
ANCHOR OR
\
-
-

>

EQUAL

TYPICAL MOTOR VEHICLE IMPACT PROTECTION

SANIWIHINDIY WALSAS TVYIINVHOIN TYHINTD



rows in the table cover newer, high-performance
elbows that have longer turning radii and smoother
walls (i.e., no mitered joints); thus, the equivalent
length is substantially reduced. When an installer dis-
cavers that the length of an exhaust duct will exceed
the limits of the code, he or she may find that using
higher performance elbows will keep the length within
the allowable limits.

M1502.4.4.2 Manufacturer’s instructions. The size and
maximum length of the exhaust duct shall be determined by
the dryer manufacturer’s installation instructions. The code
official shall be provided with a copy of the installation
instructions for the make and model of the dryer at the con-
cealment inspection. In the absence of fitting equivalent
length calculations from the clothes dryer manufacturer,
Table M1502.4.4.1 shall be used.

% This section allows the 35-foot (7620 mm) limit of the
previous section 1o be exceeded where longer
exhaust duct lengths are allowed by the appliance
manufacturer's instructions. Today’s appliances
often, but not always, permit longer distances, there-
fore this section allows the installer to take advantage
of those longer distances where specified by the
manufacturer. The make and model of the dryer must
be provided to the code official, along with the
respective installation instructions, to permit the code
official 1o inspect the duct installation based on the
manufacturer's instructions. Because the installation
is specific 1o and dependent upon a certain appliance
make and model, the code official must follow
through to make sure that the appliance did get
installed. Remember that the prime objective is to
prevent a dangerous mismatch between a dryer and
its exhaust system.

Where not otherwise specified by the dryer manu-
facturer, the flow resistance contributed by fittings
installed in the duct system must be in accordance
with Table M1502.4.4.1. Each type of fitting and its
angle is equated 10 a certain length of straight duct
and this “equivalent length” is added to the actual
straight duct length in the system to obtain the total
length. The table recognizes newer fitting designs
that have smooth bore interiors and much larger turn-
ing radii than traditionally used fittings. Such designs

EXHAUST SYSTEMS

greatly reduce friction loss as can be seen by their
much smaller equivalent lengths. If an installer is
unable to stay within the allowabie length on a partic-
ular job, he or she may find that substituting better fit-
tings will correct the problem (see Section
M1502.4.5).

M1502.4.5 Length identification. Where the exhaust duct is
concealed within the building construction. the equivalent
length of the exhaust duct shall be identified on a permanent
label or tag. The label or tag shall be located within 6 feet
(1829 mm) of the exhaust duct connection.

<+ A point to consider is the situation that will exist when
the original dryer is replaced or the original occupant
moves out and the new occupant installs a different
dryer. In either case, the replacement dryer might not
be compatible with the existing duct iength. If the duct
system equivalent length is not identified in a con-
spicuous manner, the new resident will be unaware of
the potentially hazardous situation that has been cre-
ated by the dryer and exhaust duct mismatch. It is
assumed that the instalier will be aware of the equiva-
lent length of exhaust ducts that are entirely exposed
and observable (see Commentary  Figure
M1502.4.5).

M1502.4.6 Exhaust duct required. Where space for a
clothes dryer is provided, an exhaust duct systerm shall be
installed. Where the clothes dryer is not installed at the time
of occupancy the exhaust duct shall be capped or plugged in
the space in which it originates and identified and marked
“future use.”

Exception: Where a listed condensing clothes dryer is
installed prior to occupancy of the siructure.

+Where a space is provided for the future installation
of a clothes dryer, an exhaust duct system must be
installed so that such system can be inspected and
approved (see Figure M1502.4.6). Otherwise, it is
likely that the dryer and exhaust duct system will be
installed later without the code official's knowledge
and it will not be inspected for proper installation.
Note that Section M1502.4.4.2 does not appear to be
an option when an exhaust duct system is “roughed-
in” for future use because the make, model and
exhaust capability of the dryer will be unknown. The

TABLE M1502.4.4.1
DRYER EXHAUST DUCT FITTING EQUIVALENT LENGTH

| DRYER EXHAUST DUCT FITTING TYPE

—

EQUIVALENT LENGTH

4 inch radivs mitered 45 degree elbow

-

2 feet 6 inches

4 inch radius mitered 90 degree elbow

5 feet

6 inch radius smooth 45 degree elbow

6 inch radius smooth 90 degree elbow

"1 foot

1 foot 9 inches

—

8 inch radius smooth 45 degree elbow 1 foot o
8 inch radius smooth 90 degree elbow I foot 7 inches
10 inch radius smooth 45 degree clbow 9 inches

| 10 inch radius smooth 90 degree elbow
L

{ foot 6 inches

For SI: | inch =254 mm, 1 oot = 304.8 mm, 1 degree = 0.0175 rad.

2012 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE® COMMENTARY

15-8



Public Chapter No. 529 PUBLIC ACTS, 2009 1

STATE OF TENNESEE

PUBLIC CHAPTER NO. 5629

SENATE BILL NO. 2300

By Kyle, Berke, Henry, McNally, Yager, Tate, Finney, Marrero, Herron,
Burchett, Overbey, Barnes, Ford

Substituted for: House Bill No. 2318

By Winningham, Hackworth, Kevin Brooks, Eldridge, Phillip Johnson, Mike
Turner, McCord, Pitts, Curt Cobb, Maddox, McDonald, Hardaway, Miller, John
Deberry, Ulysses Jones, Camper, Lollar, Brown, Favors, Watson, Bone,
Armstrong, Tindell, Sherry Jones, Shaw, Yokley, Shepard, Pruitt, Borchert,
Sontany, Gilmore, Dean, Coleman, McManus, West, Coley, Fitzhugh

AN ACT to amend Tennessee Code Annotated, Title 4, Chapter 3, and 22; Title 12,
Chapter 3; Title 87, Chapter 6; Title 68, Chapter 120 and Title 71, Chapter 5,
relative to energy efficiency and conservation.

WHEREAS, ensuring clean, safe, reliable and affordable energy is critical to the
prosperity of Tennessee's economy, the sustainability of Tennessee's environment and
the general welfare of Tennessee's citizens; and

WHEREAS, Tennessee's citizens, businesses, and governments face escalating
energy costs and varying environmental effects of energy production and consumption;
and

WHEREAS, state government, as one of the largest consumers of energy within
Tennessee, has the capacity and responsibility to lead by example in improving energy
efficiency and conservation; and

WHEREAS, Tennessee sees especially unique opportunities in promoting
residential energy efficiency in the wake of findings that show the Volunteer State has
the highest per capita residential electricity consumption in the nation; and

WHEREAS, Tennessee is home to a wealth of public and private resources that
can drive the development of clean energy technology and increase economic
development potential in the energy sector; and

WHEREAS, the governor's task force on energy policy, comprised of
representatives of state agencies and the General Assembly and individuals
representing business, environmental and other interests, worked throughout 2008 to
develop recommendations that could serve as the basis for a sound, comprehensive
energy policy for Tennessee; now, therefore,

BE IT ENACTED BY THE GENERAL ASSEMBLY OF THE STATE OF TENNESSEE:



Public Chapter No. 529 PUBLIC ACTS, 2009 2

SECTION 1. This act shall be known and may be cited as the "Tennessee Clean
Energy Future Act of 2009".

SECTION 2. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 4-3-1012, is amended by
deleting the words "office of energy management” in subsection (a) and substituting
instead the words "state building energy management program".

SECTION 3. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 4-3-1012, is amended by
adding the following language as a new subsection (c):

(c) The energy management program described in subsection (b) may
include, but is not limited to, implementing energy cost saving measures in
buildings under the jurisdiction of the State Building Commission. The measures
may include, but shall not be limited to, maintenance, repair or replacement of
lighting and mechanical equipment and related controls. Energy cost saving
measures may be implemented through contracts with energy professionals
including, but not limited to, energy service companies, commissioning and retro
commissioning firms and agencies and energy auditing consultants. Such
contracts are subject to approval by the State Building Commission. All
departments, institutions and agencies having control of, or responsibility for, the
management or operation of buildings under the jurisdiction of the State Building
Commission shall cooperate with state building energy management in
implementing energy cost saving measures.

SECTION 4. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 4-3-1017, is amended by
deleting the words "office of energy management” in subsection (a) and substituting
instead the words "state building energy management program”.

SECTION 5. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 4-3-1017, is amended by
deleting the words "Encouragement of the use of" in subdivision (a)(2) and substituting
instead the words "Development and implementation of projects using”.

SECTION 6. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 4-3-1018, is amended by
deleting subsection (b) in its entirety and substituting instead the following:

(b) Each person designated as a liaison with the depariment shall
cooperate with and assist the department in conducting energy audits of the
building or group of buildings for which such person is the designated liaison, as
well as any other studies or plans carried out by the department under the
provisions of this chapter or energy efficiency codes. Duties of such person shalil
include, but not be limited to, collecting energy use and other data requested by
the department, assisting the department in identifying energy use reduction
opportunities, implementing energy use reduction efforts and monitoring and
reporting results following such efforts.

SECTION 7. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 4-3-1109, is amended by
deleting the second sentence of subsection (a) and substituting instead, "Each year,
every effort should be made to achieve a target goal that one hundred percent (100%) of
newly purchased passenger motor vehicles be energy-efficient motor vehicles.".



Public Chapter No. 5629 PUBLIC ACTS, 2009 3

SECTION 8. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 4-3-1109, is further amended
by adding the following language after the second sentence in subsection (a):

The department shall ensure that at least twenty-five percent (25%) of newly
purchased passenger motor vehicles procured for use in areas designated by the
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency (EPA) as ozone nonattainment areas
shall be hybrid-electric vehicles, provided that such vehicles are available at the
time of procurement. In the event that such vehicles are not available at the time
of procurement, the department may instead meet this mandate by procuring
compact fuel-efficient vehicles. In areas not designated by the EPA as ozone
nonattainment areas, the department shall ensure that at least twenty-five
percent (25%) of newly purchased passenger motor vehicles are hybrid-electric
vehicles or compact fuel-efficient vehicles.

SECTION 9. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 4-3-1109(b)(2), is amended by
adding the following language as a new subdivision:

(C) Plans for integrating energy-efficient motor vehicles identified in
Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 4-3-1109(c)(1)(E) and (G), into the state
passenger motor vehicle fleet.

SECTION 10. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 4-3-1109(c)(1)}C), is
amended by deleting the word "or".

SECTION 11. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 4-3-1109(c)(1)(D), is
amended by inserting after the word "A" and before the word, "vehicle" the words,
"compact fuel-efficient vehicle, defined as a".

SECTION 12. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 4-3-1109(c)(1)}(D), is further
amended by deleting the word "and" following the semicolon and substituting instead the
word "or".

SECTION 13. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 4-3-1109(c)(1), is further
amended by adding the following language as new subdivisions:

(E) An electric vehicle (EV);
(F) A vehicle powered by natural gas; or

(G) A vehicle powered by ultra low sulfur diesel fuel that meets Bin 5, Tier
[l emission standards mandated by the EPA and that has an EPA-estimated
highway mileage rating of at least thirty (30) miles per gallon or greater for the
model year purchased.

SECTION 14. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 12-3-605, is amended by
adding the following language as new, appropriately designated subsections:

( ) All future office equipment, appliances, lighting, and heating and
cooling products and systems purchased by and for state agencies shall be
Energy Star qualified, provided that such Energy Star qualified products and
systems are commercially available.



Public Chapter No. 529 PUBLIC ACTS, 2009 4

() Existing purchasing contracts for all state agencies that do not provide
as options Energy Star qualified office equipment, appliances, lighting and
heating and cooling products and systems shall not be renewed upon expiration.
All future contracts for state agencies shall provide as options Energy Star
qualified office equipment, appliances, lighting and heating and cooling products
and systems.

( ) The Department of General Services, in consultation with the
Department of Finance and Administration, shall establish and publish guidelines
providing direction to all state agencies regarding implementation of this section.

SECTION 15. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 67-6-232(b)(1), is amended
by deleting the language "or emerging occupations,” and by substituting instead the
language "emerging occupations, or clean energy technology, including, but not limited
to, clean energy technology research and development and instaliation,”.

SECTION 16. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 67-6-232(b)(1), is further
amended by deleting the period (".") after the words "trade show facilities" and
substituting instead the following:

; provided, however, that emerging industry can include those primarily engaged
in manufacturing clean energy technology. For the purposes of this section, clean
energy technology means technology resulting in energy efficiency, technology
used to generate energy from biomass, geothermal, hydrogen, hydropower,
landfill gas, nuclear, solar, and wind sources, and technology that is designed to
result in the development of advanced coal through carbon capture and
sequestration or otherwise any other manner that significantly reduces CO2
emissions per unit of energy generated. Notwithstanding any other provision of
this section, businesses engaged in the development and construction of coal
fired power plants shall not be eligible for the emerging industry tax credit. The
credit provided under this section shall apply only if the Commissioner of
Revenue and the Commissioner of Economic and Community Development have
determined that allowance of the credit is in the best interests of the state. For
purposes of this section, "best interests of the state” includes, but is not limited
to, a determination that the taxpayer made the minimum investment as a result of
the credit.

SECTION 17. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 67-6-232(c), is amended by
deleting the period (".") after the language "67-4-2109(a)-(c)" and by substituting instead
the language "and the exemption provided under § 67-6-206(a).".

SECTION 18. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 68-120-101(a), is amended
in subdivision (1) by inserting the language "energy efficiency;" between the language
"structural strength and stability;" and "means of egress;".

SECTION 19. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 68-120-101(a), is amended
by adding the following as a new subdivision (8):

(8) Shall not include mandatory sprinkler requirements for one-family and
two-family dwellings; however, notwithstanding the foregoing, local governments
may adopt more stringent requirements for one-family and two-family dwellings;



Public Chapter No. 529 PUBLIC ACTS, 2009 5

(9) The department shall analyze the cost and effectiveness of sprinkler
equipment in one-family and two-family dwellings in areas where residential
sprinklers are in use, including Tennessee and other states deemed appropriate
by the department, and report the results of such analysis to the general
assembly on or before May 1, 2010. in conducting such analysis, the department
shall seek input from nonprofit and business groups or organizations including,
but not limited to, the Tennessee Fire Chiefs Association and the Home Builders
Association of Tennessee.

SECTION 20. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 68-120-101(b), is amended
by deleting subdivision (1) in its entirety and by substituting instead the following
language:

(1)(A) The standards established pursuant to subsection (a) apply to
municipal, county, state and private buildings, including one-family and
two-family dwellings, unless otherwise provided by statute.

(B)(i) Notwithstanding subdivision (b)(1)(A), the standards
established pursuant to subsection (a) relative to one-family and
two-family dwellings do not apply in any county or municipality in
which the legislative body of the county or municipality, by a two-
thirds (2/3) vote, adopts a resolution to exempt the county or
municipality, as appropriate, from the application of statewide
standards for one-family and two-family dwellings within the
jurisdictional boundaries of the county or municipality, as
appropriate; provided, however, any action by the county
legislative body concerning the implementation of this subdivision
(B)(1)(B)(i) shall be limited to the jurisdictional boundaries outside
any municipality located within such county. Upon approving the
resolution, the presiding officer of the legislative body shall notify
the state fire marshal of the actions taken hereunder.

(i)(a) An initial resolution following July 1, 2009, may be
adopted by a county or municipal legislative body to take
effect on July 1, 2010, or at a later date stated in the
resolution.

(b) A resolution adopted pursuant to subdivision
(b)(1)(B)(ii)(a) or the adoption of any other resolution, shall
expire one hundred eighty (180) days following the date of
the election for the local legislative body next occurring
following the adoption of the resolution, but an earlier
expiration date may be stated in the resolution.

(C) The governing body of any such county or of a municipality
located in any such county which has taken the action pursuant to
subdivision (b)(1)(B) is authorized to reverse such action by adopting a
resolution to apply the provisions of subsection (a) with respect to one-
family and two-family dwellings within the jurisdictional boundaries of the
municipality or county, as appropriate; provided, that, any action by the
county legislative body concerning its actions shall be limited to the



Public Chapter No. 5629 PUBLIC ACTS, 2009 6

jurisdictional boundaries outside any municipality located within such
county. The presiding officer of the governing body shall notify the state
fire marshal of the approval of the resolution.

SECTION 21. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 68-120-101(b)(2), is
amended by deleting subdivision (A) in its entirety and substituting instead the following
language:

(A) The local jurisdiction has chosen to adopt and enforce building
construction and fire safety codes for construction of all buildings; for
construction of all buildings other than one-family and two-family dwellings; or for
construction of one-family and two-family dwellings only; and

() For one-family and two-family construction, it has adopted the
International Residential Code, published by the International Code
Council, Inc.,

(i) For construction other than one-family and two-family
dwellings, it has adopted a building construction safety code consisting of
the International Building Code, published by the International Code
Council, Inc., and either:

(a) The International Fire Code, published by the
International Code Council, Inc.; or

(b) The Uniform Fire Code, published by the National Fire
Protection Association, Inc., if adopted on or after July 1, 2006;
and

SECTION 22. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 68-120-101(b)(2), is
amended by deleting subdivision (B) in its entirety and substituting instead the following
language:

(B) It is adequately enforcing its code and performing any reviews of
construction plans and specifications and inspections required by the state fire
marshal under this section.

SECTION 23. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 68-120-101(b)(4), is
amended by deieting subdivision (A) in its entirety and substituting instead the following
Janguage:

(A) The local government'’s building construction safety code publications
are not current within seven (7) years of the date of the latest editions thereof,
unless otherwise approved by the state fire marshal in writing, provided,
however, that nothing herein shall require a local government to adopt a standard
more stringent than the standards enforced by the state fire marshal, pursuant to
this section, or to adopt a mandatory sprinkler requirement for one-family and
two-family dwellings; or


myates
Highlight


Public Chapter No. 529 PUBLIC ACTS, 2009 7

SECTION 24. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 68-120-101(c)(1), is
amended by inserting the words "Renovations of existing” before the words "one-family
and two-family dwellings;".

SECTION 25. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 68-120-101, is amended by
adding the following as a new subsection (f):

(H(1)(A) The state fire marshal may, in addition to the other provisions of
this part, authorize and appoint any person, employed by any municipality
or county or acting through a professional corporation pursuant to § 48-
101-601, who meets the gualifications enumerated in subdivision (f)(2) as
a commissioned deputy building inspector in this division, who shall have
all the power of other deputies and assistants to enter any one-family and
two-family dwellings to make inspections of the buildings and their
contents, and to report the inspections in writing to the commissioner. The
commissioner is directed to contract with each deputy building inspector
through the municipality or county employing the inspector or the
inspector's professional corporation to provide one-family and two-family
building inspection services. The contracts shall be entered into between
the commissioner, with the approval of the Commissioner of Finance and
Administration, and the professional corporation employing the buiiding
inspector and the building inspectors shall not be deemed employees of
the state for payroll purposes or otherwise.

(B) A deputy building inspector shall be certified by the
State of Tennessee as:

(i) a building inspector pursuant to § 68-120-113; or

(iiy a plumbing inspector pursuant to § 68-120-118;
or

(i) a mechanical inspector pursuant to § 68-120-
118.

A deputy building inspector shall be limited in performing
inspections to the discipline in which they are certified.

(C) The commissioner shall provide a program to ensure
that one-family and two-family building construction inspection
services are available throughout the state on a timely basis. An
inspection shall be considered timely if it is performed within three
(3) working days of when the request is made to the inspector,
except that an inspection of a footer shall be considered timely if it
is performed within one (1) working day of when the request is
made to the inspector.

(2)(A) Deputy building inspectors appointed by the commissioner
are authorized to inspect one-family and two-family building
construction upon receipt of a request from the owner of the
property, a licensed contractor, or from municipal governing
bodies, or from the county legislative body of the county in which



Public Chapter No. 529 PUBLIC ACTS, 2009 8

the buildings are located. Each inspector, either through their
municipality, county or professional corporation, shall be
authorized to charge for and receive a fee for each inspection.

(B) The state fire marshal shall establish a schedule of
fees to pay the cost incurred by the department for the
administration and enforcement of this part.

(C) The state fire marshal may require the inspection of
one-family and two-family dwellings with or without a request, in
the same manner that inspections are made in accordance with §
68-102-116, and the remedies for dangerous conditions shall be
the same as provided in § 68-102-117; provided, that no fees shall
be charged for making inspections direcied by the state fire
marshal as authorized by those sections.

(D) No inspection fees may be charged except where an
actual inspection is made.

(3) The state fire marshal may promulgate such rules and
regulations as necessary to carry out the provisions of this part, in
accordance with the Uniform Administrative Procedures Act, compiled in
Title 4, Chapter 5.

SECTION 26. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 71-5-401, is amended by
deleting the section in its entirety and substituting instead the following:

71-5-401.

(a)(1) The Department of Human Services shall administer any
funding received under the federal low-income energy assistance
and weatherization programs, any other federal funds for energy
assistance or energy conservation for residential units and any
state funds appropriated to the department for purposes of
providing to eligible persons energy assistance and residential
weatherization as defined by federal law or regulation. To meet
the goal of the American Recovery and Reinvestment Act of 2009,
the department shall ensure that there are qualified contractors
and contracting firms, energy auditors and auditing firms, and
energy inspectors and inspection firms qualified to provide
weatherization services and products.

(2) Administration in accordance with state plan approved
by federal government or state law.

(i) The department shall administer the low-income
energy assistance and weatherization programs in
accordance with the state plan for each program as
approved by the federal government for any federal
funding, and in accordance with any provisions of state law
for any state funding provided for such assistance.



Public Chapter No. 529 PUBLIC ACTS, 2009 9

(i) The provisions of the state plan approved by the
federal government governing the expenditure of federal
funds for such programs shall supersede any state law or
regulations that are inconsistent with the approved state
plan.

(3) Rulemaking authority.

(i) The department shall have the power to
promulgate any necessary regulations to administer the
low-income energy assistance and weatherization
programs pursuant to the provisions of the Uniform
Administrative Procedures Act, compiled in Title 4, Chapter
5.

(iiy If necessary to provide for the immediate
expenditure of any emergency low-income energy
assistance or weatherization funds in the event of any
severe energy crisis or disaster as declared by the
governor, or to provide timely assistance under any
funding criteria that require the expenditure of such funds
under any short-term funding program, the depariment
shall have authority to promulgate any necessary
regulations to implement the provision of such assistance
by public necessity rule; provided, that any permanent
rules shall be promulgated pursuant to the Uniform
Administrative Procedures Act, compiled in Title 4, Chapter
5.

(b)(1) The department may allocate to the residential
weatherization program any funds received for energy assistance
under the federal low-income energy assistance program or from
any other federal energy assistance fund up to the maximum
amount permitted by federal law.

(2) Any separate state funding for energy assistance shall
be allocated as authorized in the annual appropriations act.

(c) Notwithstanding any state law or regulation to the contrary, the
department may provide residential weatherization assistance at any
percentage of the federal income poverty level that is permitted by federal
law.

(d) Benefit levels shall be determined based upon those
prescribed by federal law.

SECTION 27. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 71-5-402, is amended by
deleting the section in its entirety.



Public Chapter No. 529 PUBLIC ACTS, 2009 10

SECTION 28. Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 68-120-101(b), is amended
by adding the following language as subdivision (3) and renumbering the subsequent
subdivisions appropriately:

(3) If a local jurisdiction chooses to adopt and enforce codes for only one-
family and two-family dwellings or for all buildings other than one-family and two-
family dwellings that would be subject to the codes adopted by the state fire
marshal pursuant to subdivision (a)(1), the state fire marshal shall enforce the
statewide codes with regard to those buildings for which the local jurisdiction has
not adopted and is not enforcing codes.

SECTION 29. If any provision of this act or the application thereof to any person
or circumstance is held invalid, such invalidity shall not affect other provisions or
applications of the act which can be given effect without the invalid provision or
application, and to that end the provisions of this act are declared to be severable.

SECTION 30. The provisions of this act shall be subject to sunset review
pursuant to Title 4, Chapter 5, in 2014.

SECTION 31. For purposes of rulemaking this act shall take effect upon
becoming a law, the public welfare requiring it. Sections 18 through 25 and Section 28
shall take effect July 1, 2010, the public welfare requiring it. Sections 26 and 27 of this
act shall take effect upon becoming a law, the public welfare requiring it. All remaining
sections of this act shall take effect July 1, 2009, the public welfare requiring it.

PASSED: June 12, 2009

J < ON RAMSEY
- SPEAKER OF-THE SENATE

J‘*i:u,&ﬂ*;;ﬂ_—f’

KENT W(LUAMS. SPEAKEfg
HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

APPROVED this 25th day of June 2009

'HIL BREDESEN, GOVERNDR



Budget Transfers

Commission Action Needed

Fund Amount Budget Committee Vote
101 General County $30,000.00 Recommended 5-Yes
101 General County $340,580.00 Recommended 5-Yes

101 General County $7,289.78 Recommended 5-Yes




Type of Amendment:
Transfer

Blount County Government
Budget Amendment Request

FY 13-14

DEPARTMENT: ACCOU nting

Increase/Decrease ACCOUNT: 401250
=
o +' Account Number Description Amount|
TO 101-0-401250-0 bankruptcy 10,000.00
Used with transfers 141-0-401250-0 bankruptcy 9,000.00
151-0-401250-0 bankruptcy 5,000.00
{or) 355-0-401250-0 bankruptcy 2,000.00
356-0-401250-0 bankruptcy 4,000.00
APPROPRIATION

Used with inc/dec

Total 30,000.00
sl

b - Account Number Description Amount|
FROM 101-0-401100-0 current prop tax 10,000.00
Used with transfers 141-0-401100-0 current prop tax 9,000.00
151-0-401100-0 current prop tax 5,000.00
(or) 355-0-401100-0 current prop tax 2,000.00
356-0-401100-0 current prop tax 4,000.00

EST REVENUE

Used with inc/dec
Total 30,000.00

Explanation:

Due to software upgrade in the Trustee's office, this revenue is being

recorded in a separate revenue line. This amendment will move corresponding budget.

*All requests are due to Budget Manager’s Office by noon on the Tuesday before the Budget Committee Meeting.

Signature of County Mayor/Date




Type of Amendment:
Transfer

Blount County Government
Budget Amendment Request

FY 13-14

perarTMenT: Multiple (Page 1)

Increase/Decrease ACCOUNT: Fund 101

Account Number Description Amount
TO 101-0-403200 Bank Excise Tax 27,000.00
Used with transfers 101-0-403500 Interstate Telecommunication Tax 2,700.00
101-0-422920 Victims Asistance Assessments 1,800.00
(or) 101-0-423106 DUI Litter Pick Up Option 5,000.00
101-0-423203 Officers Cost - Sheriff Info Tech 17,500.00
APPROPRIATION 101-0-429900 Other Fines, Forfeitures, Penalties 2,500.00
Used with inc/dec 101-0-431906 General Service Chg - Subdiv Plats 1,100.00
Total 57,600.00
Account Number Description Amount
FROM 101-0-433940 Data Processing Fee - Sheriff 29,647.00
Used with transfers 101-0-481302 City of Maryville 120,251.00
101-0-481303 City of Alcoa 106,800.00
{or) 101-0-481404 Contracted Services - Sheriff OT 17,000.00
101-0-489900 Other 66,882.00

EST REVENUE

Used with inc/dec
Total 340,580.00

Explanation:

Clean up Fund 101 revenue accounts for the remainder of 2013-14

4]2/ St i

Signature ovaepafthiead/E(‘a}

Signature of County Mayor/Date

*All requests are due to Budget Manager’s Office by noon on the Tuesday before the Budget Committee Meeting.



Type of Amendment:

Transfer
Increase/Decrease

Blount County Government
Budget Amendment Request

FY 13-14

peearTmenT: Multiple (Page 2)

ACCOUNT: Fund 101

Account Number

Explanation:

Clean up revenue accounts (Page 2)

Description Amount
TO 101-0-433500 Fees - Copier 1,500.00
Used with transfors 101-0-433700 Fees - Telephone Commissions 12,000.00
101-0-445300 Nonrecurring - Sale of Equipment 5,000.00
(or} 101-0-445600 Nonrecurring - Damages Recovered 500.00
101-0-445903 Other Local Revenues - Cert. Fee 30.00
APPRGPRIATION 101-0-449904 Other Local Revenues - Misc 300.00
Used with inc/dec 101-0-4499805 Other lLocal Revenues - Circuit Ct 23,500.00
Total 42,830.00
Account Number Dascription Amount
FROM
Vs weith ransfars
{or}
EST REVENUE
Used with inejdec
Total 0.00

Signature of Repariment Head/Date

*All requests are due to Budget Manager’s Office by noon on the Tuesday before the Budget Committee Meeting.

Signature of County Mayor/Date




Blount County Government
Budget Amendment Request

FY 13-14
Type of Amendment: .
Transfer oepartmenT: Multiple (Page 3)
Increase/Decrease ACCOUNT: Fuynd 101
Account Number Description Amount
TO 101-0-449907 Cther Local Revenues - Data Proc. 650.0G
Used with transfaes 101-0-448809 Other Local Rev - Telephone Repay 2,500.00
101-0-469900 Other State Revenues 5,500.00
(or} 101-0-473900 Other Direct Federal Revenue 175,000.00
101-0-481100 Prisoner Board 500,00
APPROPRIATION 101-0-481400 Contracted Services 29,000.00
Used with Lnc/dec 101-0-481402 Contracted Services - Elections 27,000.00
Total 240,150.00
Account Number Description Amount
FRGM
Uisodd with transfors
{or}
EST REVENUE
Wsed with ing fdac
Total 0.00

Explanation:

Clean up revenue accounts (Page 2)

Signature of Department Head/Date

Signature of Courty Mayor/Date

YAt requests are due to Budget Manager's Office by noon on the Tuesday before the Budget Committee Mecting.




To: Randy Vineyard, Finance Director

From: Ashley Spangler, Financial Analyst
Date: April 2, 2014
Subject: Accounting Budget Transfer

The attached budget transfer is to adjust revenue estimates for the remainder of 2013-14. There were
several estimates of revenue that will not be received this year, and those have been reduced (Sheriff
Data Processing Fee, City of Maryville, City of Alcoa, and Sheriff Contracted Services). Some of these
were changed to different accounts, and others need to be reduced for the year.

To balance the decreases, | have made adjustments to other revenue accounts that have already
exceeded their estimates for 2013-14, and some that did not have a revenue estimate, but we have
received revenue in them.

The overall change results in a decrease in the use of fund balance for 2013-14 by $66,882.



Blount County Government
Budget Amendment Request

FY 13-14

Type of Amendment; . .
Transfer v peparTMEnT: Rabies / Animal Control
increase/Decrease ACCOUNT: 101-55120
Account Number Description Amount
TO 101-0-81140-500718 Maintenance Equipment 7,289.78
Used with {ransfers
lor}
APPROPRIATION
Lsed with inc/dec
Tatal 7,289.78
Account Number Description Armount
FROM 101-55120-500399-0 Other Contracted Services 7.,288.78
Used with transfers
{or)
EST REVENUE
Used with ine/dec
Total 7.289.78
Explanation: Request to transfer money within the existing budget to purchase a zero turn

mower to maintain several acres of grass at the Blount County Animal Center

Slgr‘é’ature of Department Head/DaTG

Signature of County Mayor/Date

*All requests are due to Budget Manager's Office by noon on the Tuesday before the Budget Committee Meeting,



Selling Equipment

Crueote fd: 8295514 Customer Name:

ALL PURCHASE ORDERS MUST BE MADE QUT ALL PURCHASE ORDERS MUST BE SENT

TO (VENDOR}): TO DELIVERING DEALER:
John Deere Company Ritchie Tractor Company, Llc
2000 John Deere Run 1746 W Lamar Alexander Pk
Cary, NC 27513 Maryville, TN 37801
FED ID: 36-2382580; 865-981-3199
DUNS#E: 60-7690089 info@ritchietractor.com
JOHN DEERE 28158 GAS MiD-Z
Contract: NJPA 070313-DAC Suggested List *
Price Effective Date: March 4, 2014 $9,305.73
Selling Price *
$7,289.78
* Price per item -~ includes Fees and Non-contract items
Code Description Qty  List Price Discount%  Discount Coniract Extended
Amount Price Contract
Price
21317TC 29108 Commermal ZTrak 1 $8,225.00 23.00 $ 1 891 75 $6,333.25 $6,333.25
AR S “Standard Options - Per Unit R
Q202 Umte{i States and Canada A %000 2300 $ O 00 %000  3$0.00
1504 80 In. 7-lron Hl Side 1 $ 540.00 23.00 $ 124.20 $ 415.80 $ 415.80
Discharge Mower Deck
2000  Deluxe Comfort Seat with 1 $0.00 23.00 $0.00 $0.00 $06.00
Armrests
Standard Dptlons “i“otal $ 540.00 $124.20 $ 415.80 $ 415.80
Flerghi 1 $ 340.73 $ 340.73 $340.73
Customer Setup 1 $200.00 $ 200.00 $ 200.00
Other Charges Total $ 540.73 % 540.73 $ 540,73
Suggested Price

Confidential



JENEOR S 16TEAD

ALL PURCHASE CORIDERS MUST BE MADE OUY ALL PURCHASE ORDERS MUST BE SENT

TO (VENDOR):

John Deere Company
2000 John Deere Run
Cary, NC 27513

FED ID; 36-2382580;

DUNSH#: 60-7690989

TO DELIVERING DEALER:
Ritchie Tractor Company, Lic
1748 W Lamar Alexander Pk
Maryville, TN 37801
865-9581-3199
info@ritchietractor.com

Prepared For:
Blount County
TN

Quote Summary

Delivering Dealer:

Ritchie Tractor Company, Lic
Mike Blevens

1746 W Lamar Alexander Pk
Maryville, TN 37801

Phone: 865-981-3199
mablevens@ritchietractor.com

Guote ID: 9295514
Created On: 03 March 2014
Last Modified On: 04 March 2014
Expiration Date: 28 Aprii 2014
Equipment Summary Suggested List Selling Frice Gty Extended
JOHN DEERE ZO015B GASMID-Z.. ... ..$9,30573 . .$728978 X _ .1 = ... 8728078
Comtract NJPA 070313-DAC
Price Effective Bate: March 4, 2014
Equipment Total $ 7,289.78
* Includes Fees and Non-contract items Quote Summary
Equipment Total $7,289.78
Trade In
SubTotal $ 7,289.78
Total $7,289.78
Down Payment (C.00)
Rental Applied (0.00)
Balance Pue $7,289.78

Salesperson : X

Accepied By : X

Confidential



Budget Increases/Decreases

Commission Action Needed

Fund Amount Budget Committee Vote
101 General County $2,500.00 Recommended 5-Yes
101 General County $6,500.00 Recommended 5-Yes
101 General County $5,038.77 Recommended 5-Yes
151 Debt Service $79,992,996.08 | Recommended 5—Yes
151 Debt Service $130,929.00 Recommended 5-Yes




RESOLUTION NO. 14-04-008
Sponsored by: Commissioners Jerome Moon and Gerald Kirby
A RESOLUTION TO AMEND GENERAL COUNTY FUND BUDGET.
WHEREAS, Blount County would like to amend the General County Fund Budget to
appropriate funds for utility expenses for the remainder of the year for the Health

Department.

WHEREAS, it is deemed to be in the best interest of Blount County to amend the
General County Fund Budget as requested.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE Board of Commissioners of
Blount County, Tennessee assembled in regular session this 17" day of April, 2014 that
the General County Fund Budget shall be amended as follows:

Revenue:

101-0-489900 OFNET e $2,500.00

Appropriation:

101-55110-500415  EIECHIICItY .....ccvivirieiieiesieieeseeeee s $2,500.00

Duly authorized and approved this 17" day of April, 2014

CERTIFICATION OF ACTION ATTEST
Commission Chairman County Clerk
Approved:
Vetoed:

County Mayor Date



Blount County Government
Budget Amendment Request

Reset Data

FY 13-14 .
Print Form
Type of Amendment:
Transfer pepARTMENT: Local Health Center
Increase/Decrease (] ACCOUNT: 101- 55110
Account Number Description Amount
TO
Used with transfers
101-055110-500415-0 Electricity 2,500.00
(or)
APPROPRIATION
Used with inc/dec
Total 2,500.00
Account Number Description Amount
FROM 101-0-489900-0 Other 2,500.00
Used with transfers
(or)
EST REVENUE
Used with inc/dec
Total 2,500.00
Explanation: To cover utility costs due to inclimate weather.
Signature of Department Head/Date Signature of County Mayor/Date

*All requests are due to Budget Manager’s Office by noon on the Tuesday before the Budget Committee Meeting.




RESOLUTION NO. 14-04-009
Sponsored by: Commissioners Steve Samples and Gerald Kirby
A RESOLUTION TO AMEND GENERAL COUNTY FUND BUDGET.
WHEREAS, Blount County would like to amend the General County Fund Budget to
appropriate funds for an Emergency Management grant for training exercises for first

responders in the County.

WHEREAS, it is deemed to be in the best interest of Blount County to amend the
General County Fund Budget as requested.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE Board of Commissioners of
Blount County, Tennessee assembled in regular session this 17" day of April, 2014 that
the General County Fund Budget shall be amended as follows:

Revenue:

101-0-475900-54456  Other Federal Through State...........cccccoooverennee. $6,500.00

Appropriation:

101-54410-399-54456 Other Contracted ServiCes ......ccoocvveeeeeeeeeecieeennn.. $6,500.00

Duly authorized and approved this 17" day of April, 2014

CERTIFICATION OF ACTION ATTEST
Commission Chairman County Clerk
Approved:
Vetoed:

County Mayor Date



Blount County, Tennessee
REQUEST FOR BUDGET INCREASE/DECREASE
Fiscal Year 2010-2011

Fund Number 101 Cost Center Number 054410
Fund Name General County Cost Center Name EMA (Civil Defense)
ACCOUNT NUMBER ACCOUNT NAME AMOUNT
101-054410-500299/54456 2014 Department of Military pass through 6,500.00
Appropriation: HEMPG Grant
Total Appropriation: 6,500.00
ACCQUNT NUMBER ACCOUNT NAME AMOUNT
Estimated (O H75500 - 5Y%% (x| 2014 Department of Military pass through 6,500.00
Revenue: HMEPG Grant
Total Estimated Revenue: 8,500.00

Reason for requested increase/decrease:

Contract #40622 received for training,exercises, planning, management & administration and equipment purchases allowable under
the FFY 2014 Emergency Management Performance Grant (EMPG) program. This Grant is 100 % reimbursabie,

Note:

Total appropriation Signature of Departgent Head Date

must agree with total

estimated revenue. % M b =07~ 07 oS
O |




7-08-13 GG

X2 GRANT CON

TRACT

{cost reimbursement grant contract with a federal or Tennessee iocal or quasi-governmentai entity)

Begin Date End Date Agency Tracking # Edison iD
10/01/2013 09/30/2014 3410119214 40622
Contractor Legal Entity Namae Edison Vendor ID
BLOUNT COUNTY 15
Subrecipient or Vendor CFDA ¥
E Subrecipient D Vendor 20.703

Service Caption (one line only)

U.5. DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION PASS-THROUGH FUNDING FOR FY 2014 HAZARDOUS MATERIALS EMERGENCY PLANNING GRANT

Funding —

FY . State Faderal Interdepartmental | Other TOTAL Contract Amount
2014 6,500.00 6,500.00

TOTAL: 6,500.00 6,500.00

American Recovery and Reinvestment Act {ARRA) Funding:

[Jves Dno

Budget Officer Confirmation: There is a balance in the
appropriation from which obligations hereunder are
required {o be paid that is not aiready encumbered {0 pay

other obligations.

Account Code (optional)
71301000

Speed Chart (optional)

OCR USE - GG

e MR o ey

Y
L0




Blount County, Tennessee

Grant (Contract) Worksheet
(adopted February 21, 2013}

Please provide the information below for any Grant being applied for or recently awarded.
Once completed, return the worksheet via e-mail to the Grant Accountant at accounting@blounttn.arg.

Requesting Department: Blount County EMA/ 101-054410

Contact Person's Name, email, phone # {person applying for

grant): Kathy Shields/ kshields@blounttn.org/ 273-5836
Financial Reporting Persen's information (if different than

contact):

Project/Program Director's Name, email, phone #

Name of Granting Agency: TEMA/ Dept. of Military

Grant Name: 2014 Hazrdous Materials Emergency Planning Grant (HEMPG)
Is a grant application required? yes

Is this a one-time grant? yes

Grant Funds Requested: Yes, but they will be spent from an exsisting EMA account

Are County Funds Required (Match)? if so when
approved, a budget amendment for match will need to be included
with this form $6,500.00 reimbursed/ $1,625.00 matching Total $8,125.00

Total Amount of Grant: $ 6,500

Brief Description for Use of Grant Funds: Training of &ll First Respondes re Hazardous Material

(Equipment, Gear, Personnel, etc.)

If the grant is in the application processes, what is the
submission deadline? 10/16/2013

Worksheet reviewed by -
Grant Accountant and/or Finance Director:

Date of Commission approvai:

Please provide the remaining information once the Grant is approved.

Grant CFDA# (Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance): 20,703
Date of Grant Award: 312672014
Grant Period: {(such as: Oct 1 - Sept 30} 10-01-13/9-30-14

Expiration Date of Grant, as estabiished by the Granting

Agency;

Anticipated Closing Date of Grant Project: 713072014

. . ) . direct deposit
How will we receive the Grant Funds? {direct deposit,

check, other)

. One payment
How ofter: will the Grant Funds be sent? (monthly,

quaretly, one payment, other)

w*+ Attach Budget Amendment(s) to this form when grant approved ****



RESOLUTION NO. 14-04-010
Sponsored by: Commissioners Steve Samples and Mike Lewis
A RESOLUTION TO AMEND GENERAL COUNTY FUND BUDGET.

WHEREAS, Blount County would like to amend the General County Fund Budget to
appropriate funds for buying back properties related to the 2014 Trustee tax sale.

WHEREAS, it is deemed to be in the best interest of Blount County to amend the
General County Fund Budget as requested.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE Board of Commissioners of
Blount County, Tennessee assembled in regular session this 17" day of April, 2014 that
the General County Fund Budget shall be amended as follows:

Revenue:

101-0-489900 OLNET . $5,038.77

Appropriation:

101-51900-500599  Other Charges .........ccooerereeenereiisenerese s $5,038.77

Duly authorized and approved this 17" day of April, 2014

CERTIFICATION OF ACTION ATTEST
Commission Chairman County Clerk
Approved:
Vetoed:

County Mayor Date



Blount County Government
Budget Amendment Request

FY 13-14
Type of Amendment: i
Transfer Department: Other Gen Admin
Increase/Decrease Account: 51900
Account Number Description Amount
TO 101-051900-500599-0 Other charges 5,038.77
Used with transfers
{or)
APPROPRIATION
Used with inc/dec
Total 5,038.77
Account Number Description Amount
FROM 101-0-489900-0 Other 5,038.77
Used with transfers
for)
EST REVENUE
Used vathanc/dec
Total 503877

Explanation:

2014 Trustee tax sale for properties County had to buy back

Midud

Sup,r-alurc-\of/?vi\:'nll'Denar ent Head/Dgte Signature of County Mayor/Date

“All requests are due to Financial Analyst’s Office by noon on the Tuesday before the Budget Committee Meeting.




Goddard & Gamble, /\ummy%
101 West Broadway
Suite 208
Maryvitle, Tennessee 37801
Telephone 865.982-6731
Facginile 865-982-6733

Dater _ 'w ) /(/ . S
To: //]/1 aw()r &d A /c//le// 02 ?5 570
Attention of: \>( O ]L/" (;/ A/ 25 = =l - ‘) g / 0

Fax Number:

Message M// DL e fedeilving his ledter.

df/uz o Ol revisieve D LAem X
Z/ 7 7 A_)hf‘é’,ﬂy ﬁ/ <o %{,‘g,//\_c/:,@g d g

”’ ol o opad 0f e ) Aok

oy
Nurnber of pages sent: \j _(including this page)
Sent by: /\_@ //) ( S ()( d LA 0/ ] .
Oripinal Document: ______/_(__“ : Will not follow

Wikl follow by U, S, Maj
Will follow by other means

g’;_()NFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

Ty facsimile transmission and the documents accompanying 1t may eontain con hd*qfns
formation belonging to the sender which is intended only for the use of the addresse
above. 11 you are notthe intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any c‘miﬂau e,

C@p}nnﬁ distibution or the taking of any action in rellance on the contenis of ths
information is strictly prohibited. If you have veceived s transmission i errey, not iy
us by talephone to arange for the retura of tng tr ansnission and the documents with

* 515 45
Loy £ 0 ey

/M) N 1Al w /fg N

CGUUEARER G Y Coddard & Canble FAX Mo BER98ZET3S SOnn/0ne

AAAAA

5)



HARS TS/ 2004 /0ED D4 he

Pi

f_,_’

M. H GAMBLLE, 1871 - 1934
HOMER A GODDARI, 1591 - 1960
LCOGAMBLE, 1904 - 1587

ML GAMBLE, JR., 1914 - 1980

CAREL T MelON
ROBERT ’J (*(:n‘ma\n

DEANE M. BICKS*
*ALSO LICENSED IN FLORIDA

VIA FACSIMI

Coddard & Camble

FAL Ho. 8659526733

GODDARD & GAMBLE ATTORNEYS
101 W}ss_*r BROADWAY

MARYVILL

[TE 208

"[I SNNESSER 37801

March 19, 2014

L ONLY

Mi. Ed Mitchell, Mayor

Blount County

Cowrthouse

341 Coit Street

Maryville, TN
Fax #273-53705

Mr. Scott Grav
Bleant County
347 Court
l‘\i’ ‘n"\f\filh" TN

37804

o
Trustee

Street

A7E04

;i\ﬁ; FeS59H)

Dear Eddie ane

I Seott

002008

TELEPHORE (865) 982-6731
FACEIMILE (845) 982-6733
gandprity@bellsouthnet

The delinguent property tax sale was held today and the County purchased eight
parcels of property, I have given the information on these eight tracts to Justin Teagne

for an environmental review,

Assuming that the tax payers to not pay the taves within

the next few days, 1 will need a check from Scott to pay the Clerk and Master for the

pavment of the

se eight parcels,

from the Trostee to the Clerk and Master are as follows:

Ien No.
212
215
217
718
Rt
221
227
407

Parce] No.
GOSE-A-028.00
0F5K-C-013.00
QO5IC-C-015.00
Q95T -095K-D-034.00
OBE1L-0DSKF-012.07
O95L-B-001.00
106G-1061-A-307 .00
0471-Q47P-B-019.00

The parcels which were sold and the amount of the check

Ampount for payment to the Clerk & Master

5376.13
$421.88
$457.28
$600.35
363575
$2,072.40
$474.98

$536.68 {quwi /r);,} ﬂk{ ,gj L{ }i o



Coddard & Gamble FAL e G0RG8767553 Yoo,

oLt Ry T
i i

Mr. d Mitchell

M. Seolt Graves
March 16, 2014

Page 2

Therefare, the total amount of the check to the Clerk and Master will be for $5,575.45,
scott, I will be in toueh with you towards the end of next week, I will need to get a check
from you by March 31, 2014, il these are not paid in the meantime.

Yours very truly,
7

IL\DO /QJ?/’(.% i LZ/L ‘ "/zj'(')(jﬁ‘/@/\()/ ////'l Vi 5,'_,\_,.

Ja—

LNGea



RESOLUTION NO. 14-04-012
Sponsored by: Commissioners Steve Samples and Mike Lewis
A RESOLUTION TO AMEND DEBT SERVICE FUND BUDGET.

WHEREAS, Blount County would like to amend the Debt Service Fund Budget to
appropriate funds for the refunding of certain debt (E-1-A and E-5-A).

WHEREAS, it is deemed to be in the best interest of Blount County to amend the Debt
Service Fund Budget as requested.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE Board of Commissioners of
Blount County, Tennessee assembled in regular session this 17" day of April, 2014 that
the Debt Service Fund Budget shall be amended as follows:

Revenue:

151-0-491000 Bonds ISSUEA .......ooeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeee e $79,800,000.00

151-0-489900 Ot et $192,996.08
TOLA e $79,992,996.08

Appropriation:

151-99300-500699 Other Debt ServiCe.......oovveviiveeeiiieeeeeieeeene, $79,800,000.00

151-82310-500606  Other Debt Issuance Charges.........c.cccccovevveennene. $180,000.00

151-82310-500699  Other Debt SEIVICE. .....u.eeeeee e e e $622.24

151-82210-500613 Interest on Other LoansS.........oooveeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeennn. $12,373.84
TOUAL et $79,992,996.08

Duly authorized and approved this 17" day of April, 2014

CERTIFICATION OF ACTION ATTEST
Commission Chairman County Clerk
Approved:
Vetoed:

County Mayor Date



Type of Amendment:

Transfer

Blount County Government
Budget Amendment Request
FY 13-14

Department: Debt Service

Account: \/arious

Increase/Decrease
Account Number Description Amount
TO 151-092300-500699-0 Other debt service 79,800,000.00
Msedithintansiers 151-082310-500606-0 Other debt issuance charges 180,000.00
151-082310-500699-0 Other debt service 622.24
151-082210-500613-0 Interest 12,373.84
(or)
APPROPRIATION
Used with inc/dec
Total| 79,992,996.08
Account Number Description Amount
FROM 151-0-491000-0 Bonds Issued 79,800,000.00
Used with transfers 151-0-489900-0 Other 1 92,99608

(or)

EST REVENUE

Used with inc/dec

Explanation:

To account for 2013B refunding \/@ﬁ/‘? _‘fcf'j'-/fﬁ
&

Totall 79,992,996.08

Signature of Official

epapftment Hedd/Dale

Signature of County Mayor/Date

*All requests are due to Financial Analyst's Office by noon on the Tuesday before the Budget Committee Meeting.



Sources and Uses
Sources of Funds:

Par Amount of Series 2013B Bond with US Bank S 79,800,000.00
Equity Contribution - Estimated Interest through 1/7 and fees (by County) S 12,996.08
Equity Contribution - Costs of Issuance (by County) S 180,000.00

Bond Proceeds
Other Sources of Funds
Other Sources of Funds

Total Sources S 79,992,996.08

Uses of Funds:

Refunding Requirements (Principal + Interest + Other Fees) $ 79,812,996.08
Cost of Issuance S 180,000.00

Refunding Requirements
Delivery Date Expenses

Total $ 79,992,996.08

Redemption Requirements:

Refunding Requirements

Costs of Issuance:

Total

E-5-A Principal S 29,300,000.00
E-5-A Net Interest and Other Fees - Regions December 2013 Invoice S 3,553.50
E-1-A Principal S 50,500,000.00
E-1-A Net Interest and Other Fees - Regions December 2013 Invoice S 9,442.58

$ 79,812,996.08

Cost of Issuance

FA - PFM
Swap Advisor - PFM AM

Bond Counsel - Bass, Berry

Bank Counsel - Gentry Tipton & McLemore, P.C
Total

55,000.00
20,000.00

35,000.00

$
$
$  70,000.00
s
s

180,000.00




REPORT ON DEBT OBLIGATION
(Pursuant to Tennessee Code Annotated Section 9-21-151)

1. Public Entity:
Name
Address

Blount County, Tennessee

341 Court Street

Maryville, Tennessee 37804

General Obligation Refunding Bonds, Series 2013B

2. Debt Obligation: 5. Face Amount of Debt Obligation: $79,800,000.00
| V] a. Bond Premium/Discount:
| | b. CON
| c. BAN
|| d. GAN 6. Type of Sale:
|| e. TRAN | | a. Competitive Public Sale
- f. CRAN || b. Informal Bid
g. Capital Lease || c. Negotiated Sale
I: h. Loan Agreement | d. LoanProgram
Note: Enclose a copy of the executed NOTE FORM if applicable.
3. Security For Debt Obligation: 7. Tax Status:
- | v | a Tax Exempt
v a. General Obligation || b. Tax Exempt - Bank Qualified
E b. General Obligation+Revenue+Tax || c. Taxable
| c. Revenue
| d TIF
L e. Annual Appropriations 8. Dated Date: 12/09/2013
4. Purpose of Issue: 9. Issue Date (Closing Date): 12/09/2013
- a. General Government %
- b. Education %
| c. Highways and Streets %] |10. Ratings:
- d. Public Safety % a. Moody's
| e. Solid Waste Disposal % b. Standard & Poor's
| f. Industrial Park % c. Fitch
L g. Manufacturing Facilities % d. Unrated X
- h. Health Facilities %
| i.  Airports %
L j.  Utilities %] |11. Interest Cost:
i. Water % 0.534400 % a. TIC
ii. Sewer % b. NIC
iii. Electric % c. Variable: Index 712LIBOR plys41.5  bps
iv. Gas % d. Other
k. Refunding or Renewal 100.00 %
. | 1. Other %
specify 12. Recurring Costs:
a. Remarketing Agent (bps) n/a
b. Liquidity (bps) n/a
¢. Credit Enhancements (bps) n/a
CT-0253 (Rev. 12/11)

Page 1 of 4



13. Maturity Dates, Amounts and Interest Rates

Year Amount Interest Rate Year Amount Interest Rate
2014 $125,000 % 2030 $920,000 %
2015 $120,000 % 2032 $6,600,000 %
2016 $120,000 % 2033 $7,050,000 %
2017 $120,000 % 2034 $7,400,000 %
2018 $145,000 % 2035 $7,750,000 %
2024 $5,000,000 % 2036 $8,150,000 %
2025 $5,000,000 % 2037 $8,550,000 %
2026 $5,000,000 % %
2027 $4,500,000 % %
2028 $9,500,000 % %
2029 $3,750,000 % %

If additional space is needed, attach additional sheet.
14. Repayment Schedule
This Issue Total Debt Outstanding
Cum. Principal Cum. Principal
Year Redeemed % Total Year Redeemed % Total

1 $125,000 0.16 1 $9,501,929 3.19
5 $630,000 0.79 5 $50,844,644 17.09
10 $630,000 0.79 10 $116,479,288 39.15
15 $29,630,000 3713 15 $204,555,630 68.75
20 $47,950,000 60.09 20 $263,675,630 88.62
25 $79,800,000 100.00 25 $297,525,630 100.00
30 30

Page 2 of 4




15. Itemized Description of the Cost of Issuance
(Round to Nearest Dollar)

S ER e A

BN

Financial Advisor Fees*

Legal Fees:

i. Bond Counsel

ii. Issuer's Counsel

iii. Trustee's Counsel
Bank Counsel

Paying Agent Fees and
Registration Fees
Trustee Fees
Remarking Agent Fees
Liquidity Fees
Rating Agency Fees
Credit Enhancement Fees
Underwriter's Discount %
i. Take Down
ii. Management Fee
iii. Risk Premium
iv. Underwriter's Counsel
v. Other Expenses
Printing and Advertising Fees
Issuer Fees
Real Estate Fees
Bank Closing Costs
Other Costs
Total Costs

*If other costs are included, please itemize

Name of Firm

$55,000.00 Public Financial Management

$70,000.00 Bass, Berry & Sims PLC

$35,000.00 Chapman and Cutler

$20,000.00 Swap Advisor - PFM AM
$180,000.00

Note: Enclose a copy of the DISCLOSURE DOCUMENT/ OFFICIAL STATEMENT if applicable.

16. Description of Continuing Disclosure Obligations

(Use additional pages if necessary)

Individual Responsible for Completion:

Date Annual Disclosure is due:

The 2013B Bond was purchased directly by JPMorgan Chase Bank and is not subject to Rule 15¢c2-12.




17. Description of Compliance with Written Debt Management Policy:
(Use additional pages if necessary)

The County's debt management policy is attached.

All of the proceeds of the 2013B Bonds were used to currently refund existing debt of the County. As required by the debt

policy, the decision to refund was explicitly approved by the Board of County Commissioners at a public meeting on

September 19, 2013. The refunding complies with the debt management policy as it is expected to generate positive savings

by lowering the administrative carrying cost of the County’s variable rate debt. Additionally, the direct bank placement

structure of the 2013B Bonds, eliminates the need for credit and liquidity support for the bonds, thereby lowering

the risk profile associated with the debt. The term of the 2013B Bonds is within the term of the refunded bonds.

The refunding transaction and the costs associated therewith were presented to the Board of County Commissioners at

the above-referenced public meeting.

18. (If any) Description of Derivative and Compliance with Written Derivative Management Policy:
(Use additional pages if necessary)

As described in the County's refunding plan submitted to the State on August 30, 2013, the Refunded Bonds had five

outstanding swaps between The Public Building Authority of Blount County, Tennessee and Deutsche Bank and one

outstanding swap between The Public Building Authority of Sevier County and Deutsche Bank. As part of the refunding,

the respective swaps were novated from the Public Building Authorities to the County, and the interest and obligations under

the swap agreements were moved from the Public Building Authorities to the County. No material changes or amendments

were made to the swaps. As provided in the State's Refunding Report dated September 17, 2013, the swaps

are deemed to remain under the 2002 State Refunding Board Guidelines.

19.
G. Mark Mamantov
Authorized Representative Preparer
Ed Mitchell, County Mayor Bond Counsel
Title Title

Bass, Berry & Sims PLC

Date Firm
Email Date
mmamantov@bassberry.com
Email
20.

Submitted to Governing Body on and presented at its public meeting held on

COPY TO: Director - Office of State and Local Finance, 505 Deaderick Street, Suite 1600,
James K. Polk State Office Building, Nashville TN 37243-1402

Page 4 of 4




RESOLUTION NO. 14-04-011
Sponsored by: Commissioners Jerome Moon and Gerald Kirby
A RESOLUTION TO AMEND DEBT SERVICE FUND BUDGET.

WHEREAS, Blount County would like to amend the Debt Service Fund Budget to
appropriate funds to reconcile debt service relative to the 2013 debt refinancing.

WHEREAS, it is deemed to be in the best interest of Blount County to amend the Debt
Service Fund Budget as requested.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE Board of Commissioners of
Blount County, Tennessee assembled in regular session this 17" day of April, 2014 that
the Debt Service Fund Budget shall be amended as follows:

Revenue:
151-0-481300 CoNtribBULIONS. .......oiviiiiiiiieieee s $171,646.00
151-0-489900 (@] 11 ST ($40,717.00)
TOtal ..o $130,929.00
Appropriation:
151-82310-500599  Other Charges .......cccccevveieiieieee e $2,522.00
151-82310-500699  Other Debt ServicCe........ccocovvierininiiinieiennn ($561,610.00)
151-82230-500611 Interest on Capital Leases.........ccccevevvererennniens ($9,786.00)
151-82130-500610  Principal on Capital Leases............ccccevvverveivenenn $16,927.00
151-82130-500603  Interest on BoNds ........c.ccoeevvvveiiivieeciiciiieeeee, $2,069,403.00
151-82210-500613  Interest 0N LOans.........cccceveveeveeeeesineriesnnene. (%$1,262,472.00)
151-82210-500611 Interest on Capital Leases.........cccceververerernnnens ($8,855.00)
151-82110-500612  Principal on Other Loans..........cccccceceeveevenenne. ($134,875.00)
151-82110-500601  Principal on Bonds.........cccoocvvveiienvnienneie e $46,400.00
151-82110-500610  Principal on Capital Leases..........c.cccccevvverreennnns ($26,725.00)
TOtal ..o $130,929.00

Duly authorized and approved this 17" day of April, 2014



CERTIFICATION OF ACTION ATTEST

Commission Chairman County Clerk

Approved:
Vetoed:

County Mayor Date



Blount County Government
Budget Amendment Request

FY 13-14
Type of Amendment:
Transfer Department Debt Service
Increase/Decrease Account Various
Account Number Description Amount
TO 151-082310-500599-0 Other charges 2,522.00
Used with transfers 151-082310-500699-0 Other debt service (561,610.00)
151-082230-500611-0 Interest on leases - education (9,786.00)
151-082130-500610-0 Principal on leases - education 16,927.00
(or) 151-082210-500603-0 Interest on bonds 2,069,403.00
151-082210-500613-0 Interest on loans (1,262,472.00)
151-082210-500611-0 Interest on leases (8,855.00)
151-082110-500612-0 Principal on loans (134,875.00)
APPROPRIATION 151-082110-500601-0 Principal on bonds 46,400.00
Used with inc/dec 151-082110-500610-0 Principal on leases (26,725.00)
Total 130,929.00
Account Number Description Amount
FROM 151-0-481300-0 Contributions 171,646.00
Used with transfers 151-0-489900-0 Other (40,717.00)
(or)
EST REVENUE
Used with inc/dec
Total 130,929.00

Explanation:

To reconcile debt service relative to 2013 debt refi, etc

///14

'/ /" signature of County Mayor/Date

*All requests are due to Financial Analyst’s Office by noon on the Tuesday before the Budget Committee Meeting.




Blount County Government

Memo

To: Randy Vineyard
From: Susan Gennoe
Date: April 3, 2014

Re: Debt Service Fund 151 Reconciliation

After reconciling fund 151 pursuant to the 2013 debt refinancing and taking into account the
amendment needed for the related sources/uses (see separate amendment information), the attached
amendment is needed. Highlights include:
e  Appropriations:
o $2,000 travel related expenses for PFM trips to Commission meetings

0 $22 Regions fee increase, series 2004B/2005

o0 Correcting budget for school energy facility upgrades (principal/interest on leases,
education)

o0 Shifting principal/interest between loans/bonds relative to E1IA/E5A loans becoming
2013B bonds

o Correcting Motorola budget (principal/interest on leases)
e Estimated Revenues

0 alc 481300 Contributions: Correcting Motorola and school energy facility upgrade
capital lease estimated revenue

0 a/c 489900 Difference in the changes becomes an adjustment to fund balance

Thank you.



Other Budget Items

Commission Action Needed

Item Budget Committee | Vote

Purchasing Resolution for Sale of Surplus Property Recommended 5—-Yes
Litter Grant Recommended 5-Yes
5" Judicial DUI Abatement/Prosecution Enhancement Grant | Recommended 5-Yes
2014-15 BCSO Alcohol Saturation Patrols/Roadside Sobriety | Recommended 5-Yes
Checkpoints

2014-15 BCSO High Visibility Campaign Recommended 5—-Yes
2014-15 Motorcycle/Motorist Safety — The Dragon Recommended 5-Yes
2014-15 BCSO Network Coordinator Recommended 5-Yes




RESOLUTION No. 14-04-007

Sponsored By Commissioners: Jerome Moon and Steve Samples

A RESOLUTION DECLARING THE ATTACHED LIST OF PERSONAL PROPERTY SURPLUS AND
AVAILABLE FOR SALE ON INTERNET AUCTION.

WHEREAS, Tennessee Code Annotated 5-14-108 (0) (1) states "All sales of county-owned property,
real or personal in nature, that has become surplus, obsolete or unusable shall be made by public
auction or by sealed bid under this section, in the discretion of the purchasing agent or responsible
official. “Public auction” includes sale by Internet auction.”; and

WHEREAS, the responsible official has declared the property surplus; and

WHEREAS, the Purchasing Agent has suspended internet auction sales pending approval by the
Blount County Commission of updated Blount County property management policies and procedures;
and

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of County Commissioners of Blount County,
Tennessee, meeting in session assembled this 17" day of April 2014, that the attached list of personal
property is hereby declared surplus and sale of the items by public auction is hereby authorized.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THIS RESOLUTION TAKES EFFECT FROM AND AFTER ITS
PASSAGE, THE PUBLIC WELFARE REQUIRING IT; AND THAT ANY PRIOR RESOLUTION TO THE
CONTRARY IS HEREBY DECLARED VOID.

CERTIFICATION OF ACTION ATTEST
Commission Chairman County Clerk
Approved:

Vetoed:

County Mayor Date



Aprit 2014 Surplus Items

Department Items Reason to Surplus

Contact

Ay

" [Fioat Lavmp Aoplicator & Pump | |notinworking condition.

Jrimmy-Sign'Shop -

BCSO Misc Cell Phones orking condition

Susan-Purchasing

Surplus

“[Susan Purchasing




RESOLUTION NO. 14-04-006
SPONSORED BY COMMISSIONERS MIKE LEWIS AND GERALD KIRBY

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING SUBMISSION OF APPLICATION FOR
LITTER AND TRASH COLLECTING GRANT FROM THE STATE OF
TENNESSEE, DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION AND AUTHORIZING
ACCEPTANCE OF THE GRANT

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Board of Commissioners of Blount County,
Tennessee, in session assembled this day, April 17, 2014.

WHEREAS, Blount County intends to apply for the aforementioned grant from
the Tennessee Department of Transportation; and

WHEREAS, the contract for the grant will impose certain legal obligations upon
Blount County,

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Commissioners of
Blount County Tennessee:

1. That, Edward Mitchell, County Mayor, is hereby authorized to apply on
behalf of Blount County for a litter and trash collecting grant from the
Tennessee Department of Transportation: and

2. That should said application be approved by the Tennessee Department
of Transportation, that Edward Mitchell, County Mayor, is hereby
authorized to execute contracts or other necessary documents which may
be required to signify acceptance of the litter and trash collecting grant by
Blount County.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THIS RESOLUTION TAKE EFFECT
FROM AND AFTER PASSAGE, THE PUBLIC WELFARE REQUIRING IT.

CERTIFICATION OF ACTION ATTEST
Chairman Roy Crawford
Blount County Commission County Clerk
Approved:

Vetoed:

County Mayor Date



Blount County, Tennessee
Grant (Contract) Worksheet

(adopted February 21, 2013)

Please provide the information below for any Grant being applied for or recently awarded.

Once completed, return the worksheet via e-mail to the Grant Accountant at accounting@blounttn.org.

Requesting Department: Sheriff's Office

Contact Person's Name, email, phone # (person applying for

grant): Jeff French, jfrench@bcso.com, 273-5308

Financial Reporting Person's information (if different than

contact): Beverly Collins, townsendbev@aol.com

Project/Program Director's Name, email, phone #

Name of Granting Agency: TN Department of Transportation

Grant Name: Litter Grant

Is a grant application required? YES _X NO

Is this a one-time grant? YES NO If no, is the grant recurring? _yes
Grant Funds Requested: $ 62,400.00
Are County Funds Required (Match)? If so when

approved, a budget amendment for match will need to be included

with this form No

Total Amount of Grant: $ 62,400

Brief Description for Use of Grant Funds:
(Equipment, Gear, Personnel, etc.)

Litter Grant funding pays a portion of the Sheriff's Office
expenses for the litter crew cleaning the roadside. Also helps
fund the educational services provided by Keep Blount Beautiful

If the grant is in the application processes, what is the
submission deadline? June 30, 2014

Worksheet reviewed by -

Grant Accountant and/or Finance Director:

Date of Commission approval:

Please provide the remaining information once the Grant is approved.

Grant CFDA# (Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance):

Date of Grant Award:

Grant Period: (such as: Oct 1 - Sept 30)

Expiration Date of Grant, as established by the Granting
Agency:

Anticipated Closing Date of Grant Project:

How will we receive the Grant Funds? (direct deposit,
check, other)

How often will the Grant Funds be sent? (monthly,
quarterly, one payment, other)

*+x Attach Budget Amendment(s) to this form when grant approved ****




Blount County, Tennessee

Grant (Contract) Worksheet
(adopted February 21, 2013)

Please provide the information below for any Grant being applied for or recently awarded.

Once completed, return the worksheet via e-mail to the Grant Accountant at accounting@blounttn.org.

Requesting Department: District Attorney General for the Fifth Judicial District

Contact Persons Name, email, phone # (person applying for ~Ryan Desmond. Atty. rkdesmond@tndagc.org 273.5600

grant): Doug Hancock, dhancock@blounttn.org 273.5750

Reporting Persons information (if different than contact): Ryan Desmond. Atty. rkdesmond@tndagc.org 273.5600

Name of Granting Agency: State of Tennessee, Governors Highway Safety Office
5th Judicial District 2014-15 DUI Abatement/Prosecution

Grant Name: Enhancement

Is a grant application required? YES_ X NO

Is this a one-time grant? YES NO _ X_ If no, is the grant recurring? _Yes

Grant Funds Requested:

Are County Funds Required (Match)? If so when approved,
a budget amendment for match will need to be included with this
form Not Applicable - No Matching Funds Required

Total Amount of Grant: $ 166,273

Salary and Benefits for DUI Special Prosecutor and Salary and
Benefits for Prosecutor's Assistant, Office Supplies, Fees for
Conferences, Etc.

Brief Description for Use of Grant Funds:
(Equipment, Gear, Personnel, etc.)

If the grant is in the application processes, what is the
submission deadline? 31-Mar-14

Worksheet reviewed by -

Grant Accountant and/or Finance Director:

Date of Commission approval:

Please provide the remaining information once the Grant is approved.

Grant CFDA# (Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance): To be supplied by GHSO with Grant - if awarded

Date of Grant Award:

Grant Period: (such as: Oct 1 - Sept 30)

Expiration Date of Grant, as established by the Granting
Agency:

Anticipated Closing Date of Grant Project:

How will we receive the Grant Funds? (direct deposit,
check, other)

How often will the Grant Funds be sent? (monthly,
quarterly, one payment, other)

*xx Attach Budget Amendment(s) to this form when grant approved ****



Blount County, Tennessee

Grant (Contract) Worksheet
(adopted February 21, 2013)

Please provide the information below for any Grant being applied for or recently awarded.
Once completed, return the worksheet via e-mail to the Grant Accountant at accounting@blounttn.org.

Requesting Department: Blount County Sheriff's Office
Contact Persons Name, email, phone # (person applying for
grant): Doug Hancock, dhancock@blounttn.org 273.5750
Chief Jeff French, jfrench@bcso.com 273.5308 Lt.
Reporting Persons information (if different than contact): Randy Ailey, bcso319@gmail.com 273.5136
Name of Granting Agency: State of Tennessee, Governors Highway Safety Office
2014-15 BCSO Alcohol Saturation Patrols/Roadside Sobriety
Grant Name: Checkpoints
Is a grant application required? YES _ X NO
Is this a one-time grant? YES NO _ X Ifno, is the grant recurring? __Yes

Grant Funds Requested:

Are County Funds Required (Match)? If so when approved,
a budget amendment for match will need to be included with this
form Not Applicable - No Matching Funds Required

Total Amount of Grant: $ 78,348

Funding for overtime for patrol deputies, traffic safety unit
deputies and supervisors for working Saturation Patrols for DUI,
speeding and aggressive driving and for overtime for working
Sobriety Checkpoints.

Brief Description for Use of Grant Funds:
(Equipment, Gear, Personnel, etc.)

If the grant is in the application processes, what is the
submission deadline? March 31st, 2014

Worksheet reviewed by -

Grant Accountant and/or Finance Director:

Date of Commission approval:

Please provide the remaining information once the Grant is approved.

Grant CFDA# (Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance): To be supplied by GHSO with Grant - if awarded

Date of Grant Award:

Grant Period: (such as: Oct 1 - Sept 30)

Expiration Date of Grant, as established by the Granting
Agency:

Anticipated Closing Date of Grant Project:

How will we receive the Grant Funds? (direct deposit,
check, other)

How often will the Grant Funds be sent? (monthly,
quarterly, one payment, other)

*xx Attach Budget Amendment(s) to this form when grant approved ****



Blount County, Tennessee

Grant (Contract) Worksheet
(adopted February 21, 2013)

Please provide the information below for any Grant being applied for or recently awarded.

Once completed, return the worksheet via e-mail to the Grant Accountant at accounting@blounttn.org.

Requesting Department:

Contact Persons Name, email, phone # (person applying for
grant):

Reporting Persons information (if different than contact):

Name of Granting Agency:

Grant Name:
Is a grant application required?

Is this a one-time grant?

Grant Funds Requested:

Are County Funds Required (Match)? If so when approved,

a budget amendment for match will need to be included with this
form

Total Amount of Grant:

Brief Description for Use of Grant Funds:
(Equipment, Gear, Personnel, etc.)

If the grant is in the application processes, what is the
submission deadline?

Worksheet reviewed by -

Grant Accountant and/or Finance Director:

Date of Commission approval:

Blount County Sheriff's Office

Doug Hancock, dhancock@blounttn.org 273.5750

Chief Jeff French, jfrench@bcso.com 273.5308
Randy Ailey, bcso319@gmail.com 273.5136

Lt.

State of Tennessee, Governors Highway Safety Office

2014-15 BCSO High Visibility Campaign

YES_ X NO

YES

NO _X__ If no, is the grant recurring? _Yes

Not Applicable - No Matching Funds Required

$

5,000

The High Visibility grant assists the BCSO Traffic Unit for DUI
enforcement during certain high traffic days such as Superbowl

Sunday, New Years Eve, etc.

March 31st, 2014

Please provide the remaining information once the Grant is approved.

Grant CFDA# (Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance):
Date of Grant Award:

Grant Period: (such as: Oct 1 - Sept 30)

Expiration Date of Grant, as established by the Granting
Agency:

Anticipated Closing Date of Grant Project:

How will we receive the Grant Funds? (direct deposit,
check, other)

How often will the Grant Funds be sent? (monthly,
quarterly, one payment, other)

To be supplied by GHSO with Grant - if awarded

*xx Attach Budget Amendment(s) to this form when grant approved ****




Blount County, Tennessee

Grant (Contract) Worksheet
(adopted February 21, 2013)

Please provide the information below for any Grant being applied for or recently awarded.

Once completed, return the worksheet via e-mail to the Grant Accountant at accounting@blounttn.org.

Requesting Department:

Contact Persons Name, email, phone # (person applying for
grant):

Reporting Persons information (if different than contact):
Name of Granting Agency:

Grant Name:
Is a grant application required?
Is this a one-time grant?

Grant Funds Requested:

Are County Funds Required (Match)? If so when approved,
a budget amendment for match will need to be included with this
form

Total Amount of Grant:

Brief Description for Use of Grant Funds:
(Equipment, Gear, Personnel, etc.)

If the grant is in the application processes, what is the
submission deadline?

Worksheet reviewed by -

Grant Accountant and/or Finance Director:

Date of Commission approval:

Blount County Sheriff's Office

Doug Hancock, dhancock@blounttn.org 273.5750

Chief Jeff French, jfrench@bcso.com 273.5308 Lt.
Randy Ailey, bcso319@gmail.com 273.5136

State of Tennessee, Governors Highway Safety Office

2014-15 Motorcycle/Motorist Safety -The Dragon

YES_ X NO

YES NO _ X _ Ifno, is the grant recurring? _Yes

Not Applicable - No Matching Funds Required

$ 90,925

Overtime funding for patrol division deputies, traffic safety unit
deputies and supervisors for patroling The Dragon, (U.S.
Highway 129) during peak motorcylist and sports car enthusiasts
seasons.

March 31st, 2014

Please provide the remaining information once the Grant is approved.

Grant CFDA# (Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance):
Date of Grant Award:

Grant Period: (such as: Oct 1 - Sept 30)

Expiration Date of Grant, as established by the Granting
Agency:

Anticipated Closing Date of Grant Project:

How will we receive the Grant Funds? (direct deposit,
check, other)

How often will the Grant Funds be sent? (monthly,
quarterly, one payment, other)

To be supplied by GHSO with Grant - if awarded

*xx Attach Budget Amendment(s) to this form when grant approved ****




Blount County, Tennessee

Grant (Contract) Worksheet
(adopted February 21, 2013)

Please provide the information below for any Grant being applied for or recently awarded.
Once completed, return the worksheet via e-mail to the Grant Accountant at accounting@blounttn.org.

Requesting Department: Blount County Sheriff's Office
Contact Persons Name, email, phone # (person applying for
grant): Doug Hancock, dhancock@blounttn.org 273.5750
Chief Jeff French, jfrench@bcso.com 273.5308 Lt.
Reporting Persons information (if different than contact): Randy Ailey, bcso319@gmail.com 273.5136
Name of Granting Agency: State of Tennessee, Governors Highway Safety Office
Grant Name: 2014-15 BCSO Network Coordinator
Is a grant application required? YES _ X NO
Is this a one-time grant? YES NO _X__ If no, is the grant recurring? _Yes

Grant Funds Requested:

Are County Funds Required (Match)? If so when approved,
a budget amendment for match will need to be included with this
form Not Applicable - No Matching Funds Required

Total Amount of Grant: $ 15,000

GHSOs Law Enforcement Liaison Officers (LEL's) are the point
of contact between GHSO and the Sheriff's Office. The BCSO
Network Coordinator works with LEL to carry out established
initiatives to reduce traffic fatalities and accidents.

Brief Description for Use of Grant Funds:
(Equipment, Gear, Personnel, etc.)

If the grant is in the application processes, what is the
submission deadline? March 31st, 2014

Worksheet reviewed by -

Grant Accountant and/or Finance Director:

Date of Commission approval:

Please provide the remaining information once the Grant is approved.

Grant CFDA# (Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance): To be supplied by GHSO with Grant - if awarded

Date of Grant Award:

Grant Period: (such as: Oct 1 - Sept 30)

Expiration Date of Grant, as established by the Granting
Agency:

Anticipated Closing Date of Grant Project:

How will we receive the Grant Funds? (direct deposit,
check, other)

How often will the Grant Funds be sent? (monthly,
quarterly, one payment, other)

*xx Attach Budget Amendment(s) to this form when grant approved ****



RESOLUTION No. 14-04-004

Sponsored by Commission Chairman Jerome Moon, Commission Chairman Pro Tempore
Gary Farmer, and County Mayor Ed Mitchell

A RESOLUTION REGARDING PROCEDURES FOR PLACING PORTRAITS OF
DECEASED COUNTY COMMISSIONERS IN THE COUNTY COMMISSION MEETING ROOM.

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Board of Commissioners of Blount County, Tennessee, in session
assembled April 17, 2014.

WHEREAS, placing portraits of deceased former members of the Board of Commissioners in
the meeting room of the Board of Commissioners is an appropriate way of honoring service to
the citizens of Blount County; and

WHEREAS, it is desirable to formalize an orderly procedure and guidelines for the placement of
said portraits; and

WHEREAS, the County Mayor joins with the Board of Commissioners in the effort to provide
this honor.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF BLOUNT
COUNTY, TENNESSEE:

1. That only deceased current members or deceased former members of the Board of
Commissioners of Blount County, Tennessee be so honored; and

2. That the placement of the portrait must first be authorized by a majority vote of the Board
of Commissioners; and

3. That only one portrait per commission term be authorized, except if a commissioner dies
during their term of office; and

That the portraits and frames be provided at no cost to Blount County; and

That the portrait be a single image and that the size and style of the frame be similar to
the existing portraits in the room.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THIS RESOLUTION TAKE EFFECT FROM AND AFTER
PASSAGE, THE PUBLIC WELFARE REQUIRING IT.

CERTIFICATION OF ACTION ATTEST

Commission Chairman County Clerk

Approved:

Vetoed:

County Mayor Date



Search - 1 Result - 5-6-106. Powers and duties -- Generally -- Ex officio memberships -- ... Page 1 of 1

Tenn. Code Ann. § 5-6-106

TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED
© 2014 by The State of Tennessee
All rights reserved

**k Current through the 2013 Regular Session ***

Title 5 Counties
Chapter 6 County Mayors
Part 1 Substantive Provisions

Tenn. Code Ann. § 5-6-106 (2013)
5-6-106. Powers and duties -- Generally -~ Ex officio memberships -- Appointments.

(a) The county mayor shall be the chief executive officer of the county and shall have al! the
powers and duties formerly exercised by the county judge, county chair, or elected official
exercising general supervision of the county government as provided by this chapter, other
general law, special, local or private acts.

(b) (1) The county mayor shall serve as a nonvoting ex officio member of the county
legislative body. The county mayor or the county mayor's designated representative shall serve
as a nonvoting ex officio member of each committee of the county legislative body and of each
board, commission or authority of the county government, except as provided by law or by
action of the county legislative body.

(2) In those circumstances not addressed by the provisions of subdivision (b)(1), the county
mayor may designate, from time to time, a professional staff member with appropriate training
or a member of the county legislative body to sit in the county mayor's place on any board,
authority or commission that the county mayor serves upon by virtue of holding the office of
county mayor. Any such designee shall have the powers, including the power to vote, as are
otherwise conferred upon the county mayor when serving upon such board, authority or
commission. At any such meeting attended by the county mayor, only the county mavyor shall
exercise voting power.

(c) Except as otherwise provided by general law, or special or private act, the county mayor
shall appoint members of county boards and commissions and county department heads. Such
appointees shall be subject to confirmation by the county legislative body, and in so doing, the
legislative body may express its views fully and freely and shall vote for or against
confirmation. The legislative body shall not seek or interview such prospective employees prior
to their appointment by the county mayor. Such appointment and confirmation are not
applicable to employees appointed by other elected county officials.

HISTORY: Acts 1978, ch. 934, § 17; 1979, ch. 80, § 1; T.C.A., § 5-606; Acts 1985, ch. 145, §
1; 2003, ch. 90, § 2.

L{”XMNE“’RE% About LexisNexis | Privacy Policy | Terms & Conditions | Contact Us
SIREREE RS Copyright © 2014 LexisNexis, a division of Reed Elsevier Inc. All rights reserved.

https://web.lexisnexis.com/research/retrieve? m=01ebdf303511dec160ceb468cd359clb& ... 4/1/2014



BLOUNT COUNTY

Office of the County Clerk

345 COURT STREET, MARYVILLE, TENNESSEE 37804-5906

Roy Crawford, Jr. Telephone (865) 273-5800
County Clerk Fax (865) 273-5815

March 25, 2014
[commissioner]
[address]
[city/state/zip]

Dear Commissioner [commissioner]:

Pursuant to Tennessee Code Annotated 85-5-111, it is my sad duty to inform you of the

death of Gordon Wright, Sr. on March 19, 2014. A vacancy now exists in the office of County

Commissioner, District 8, Seat B. | have included the applicable statutes for your information.
If you need further information, please let me know.

Sincerely,
g=X¢ ,

Roy Crawford, Jr.
County Clerk
enclosures



Tenn. Code Ann. 8 5-1-104

TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED
© 2014 by The State of Tennessee
All rights reserved

*** Current through the 2013 Regular Session ***

Title 5 Counties
Chapter 1 General Provisions
Part 1 Counties Generally

Tenn. Code Ann. § 5-1-104 (2013)
5-1-104. County officers -- Filling vacancies.

(a) Each organized county shall have, in addition to the judicial officers elected by the
qualified voters or by the county legislative body, such other officers as are authorized by
law to manage county business.

(b) (1) Vacancies in county offices required by the Constitution of Tennessee or by any
statutory provision to be filled by the people shall be filled by the county legislative body,
and any person so appointed shall serve until a successor is elected at the next general
election, as defined in § 2-1-104, in the county and is qualified. The county legislative body
shall be required to make an appointment to fill a vacancy within one hundred twenty (120)
days of receiving notice of the vacancy unless during that time period there is a general
election scheduled in the county and there is sufficient time for the vacancy to be placed on
the ballot in accordance with this section. Any appointment to fill a vacancy by the county
legislative body shall be made in accordance with chapter 5, part 1 of this title. This subdivi-
sion (b)(1) shall not apply to any county that has a metropolitan form of government and a
population in excess of five hundred thousand (500,000), according to the 2000 federal
census or any subsequent federal census. This subdivision (b)(1) shall not apply in any
county having a population of not less than eight hundred ninety-seven thousand four hun-
dred (897,400) nor more than eight hundred ninety-seven thousand five hundred
(897,500), according to the 2000 federal census or any subsequent federal census.

(2) If the vacancy occurs after the time for filing nominating petitions for the party pri-
mary election and more than sixty (60) days before the party primary election, then nomi-
nees of political parties shall be selected in such primary election and a successor elected in
the August general election. If the vacancy occurs less than sixty (60) days before the party
primary election but sixty (60) days or more before the August election, then nominees of
political parties shall be selected by party convention and a successor elected in the August
election. If the vacancy occurs less than sixty (60) days before the August election but sixty
(60) days or more before the November election, then nominees of political parties shall be
selected by party convention and a successor elected in the November election.

(3) If a vacancy occurs more than ten (10) days prior to the regular qualifying deadline,
then the regular qualifying deadline shall apply. If the vacancy occurs after the tenth day
prior to the regular qualifying deadline, independent candidates and candidates nominated
by any political party for the vacancies shall qualify by filing all nominating petitions no later
than twelve o'clock (12:00) noon, prevailing time, on the fifty-fifth day before the election.
If the qualifying deadline is the fifty-fifth day before the election, candidates must withdraw



no later than twelve o'clock (12:00) noon, prevailing time, on the fifty-second day before
the election.

(©) Notwithstanding any provision of law or any provision of any charter of a metropolitan
government to the contrary, whenever an election is held to fill a vacancy in a county office
that is elected from districts, including, but not limited to, county school board members,
county legislative body members, county highway commissions, and constables, the county
legislative body may provide by resolution duly certified to the county election commission
that persons qualifying as candidates shall be elected from the most recently adopted reap-
portionment plan in the county. If the county legislative body requires the election to be
held using districts as adopted in the most recently adopted reapportionment plan in the
county, the county legislative body shall specify to the county election commission which
district shall be used to fill the vacancy by election. In the absence of a resolution requiring
the latest reapportionment plan be used and specifying which district shall be used for the
election, the election shall be held using the district as constituted for the election of the va-
cated incumbent.

HISTORY: Code 1858, § 406 (deriv. Const. 1834, art. 7, 8 1); impl. am. Acts 1870, ch. 98,
8 1; Shan., § 498; Code 1932, 8§ 744; Acts 1975, ch. 354, 8§ 1; 1978, ch. 934, 8§ 2, 24;
1979, ch. 10, 88 1, 2; T.C.A. (orig. ed.), 8 5-104; Acts 1981, ch. 314, § 1; 1981, ch. 318, §
1; 1992, ch. 707, 8 1; 1997, ch. 558, 8§ 24, 25; 2007, ch. 125, § 8; 2008, ch. 871, 8 1;
2013, ch. 231, 8§ 11.



Tenn. Code Ann. 8 5-5-111

TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED
© 2014 by The State of Tennessee
All rights reserved

*** Current through the 2013 Regular Session ***

Title 5 Counties
Chapter 5 County Legislative Bodies
Part 1 Substantive Provisions

Tenn. Code Ann. § 5-5-111 (2013)

5-5-111. Filling vacancies -- Notice to legislative body -- Notice to public -- Nomi-
nations -- Appointment by vote of legislative body -- Challenge of appointment --
Deadline -- Applicability of provisions.

(a) (1) Whenever an office is required to be filled, or a vacancy occurs in any office re-
quired to be filled, by the county legislative body, the county clerk shall provide notice to
every member of the county legislative body of the need to fill the office or vacancy. If the
office of county clerk is vacant, the notice shall be provided by the county clerk's deputy. If,
in addition, there is no deputy county clerk, notice shall be provided by the acting chair of
the county legislative body. In accordance with § 8-48-108, the formal notice to members
required by this subdivision (a)(1) is directory and may be waived by the members of the
county legislative body if all members have constructive notice of the vacancy or opening
through other sources of information.

(2) In addition to the notice provided for in subdivision (a)(1), the presiding officer of the
county legislative body shall cause public notice to be given in a newspaper of general circu-
lation in the county at least seven (7) days prior to the meeting of the body at which the
office is to be filled, notifying the public of the vacancy or opening and specifying the office
or offices to be filled at the meeting.

(b) Before the county legislative body votes or considers any motion or resolution regarding
the office to be filled, the chair shall allow registered voters of the county an opportunity to
submit names to the county legislative body for consideration. The names may be submit-
ted in writing to the chair prior to the meeting or may be submitted in person at the meet-
ing. In order for a name to be considered, a member of the county legislative body must
subsequently nominate the person. Members of the county legislative body may also nomi-
nate a candidate or candidates to fill the office or vacancy without the name being submit-
ted by a voter. Nominations do not require a second. If the person nominated is not present
at the meeting, the person making the nomination shall submit a signed statement from the
nominee that the nominee is willing to serve in the office if appointed.

(c) Should a member of the county legislative body accept a nomination for an office or va-
cancy that is required by the Tennessee constitution to be filled by the county legislative
body, the member shall be prohibited from voting on the appointment or any motions or
resolutions relative to making the appointment until the office or vacancy is filled. For the
purposes of determining a majority, the membership of the county legislative body shall be
reduced to reflect any member or members prohibited from voting on the appointment. If a
member of the county legislative body is subsequently appointed to fill the office or vacan-
cy, the member shall immediately resign from the county legislative body upon accepting



the appointment. If the member does not receive the appointment, the member shall not be
required to resign and may continue the member's duties on the county legislative body up-
on the conclusion of the vote on the appointment.

(d) After nominations cease, the county legislative body may discuss the nominations and
may, at the discretion of the chair, interview nominees or allow nominees the opportunity to
address the county legislative body. Upon motion passed by the majority of the members,
the vote to make the appointment may be postponed to a subsequent meeting, provided
that adequate public notice of the meeting is given in accordance with title 8, chapter 44.

(e) To receive an appointment, a nominee must receive the votes of a majority of the
members of the county legislative body eligible to vote on the appointment. The county leg-
islative body shall adopt rules of procedure for eliminating nominees in cases where there
are multiple nominees for an appointment and no nominee receives a majority of the votes
after the initial vote. No secret balloting shall be permitted. Each member's vote regarding
the appointment process shall be recorded by the clerk and entered on the minutes of the
county legislative body. A tie vote of the county legislative body regarding an appointment
may be broken in the same manner that other tie votes of the body may be broken.

(f) Any complaint challenging the legality of an appointment made by the county legislative
body shall be filed with the chancery court of the county within ten (10) days of the date of
the appointment.

(9) When filling a vacancy in offices required to be filled by the county legislative body, the
county legislative body shall fill the vacancy in accordance with the deadline provided in 8§ 5-
1-104.

(h) (1) This section shall not apply to any county that has a metropolitan form of govern-
ment and a population in excess of five hundred thousand (500,000), according to the 2000
federal census or any subsequent federal census.

(2) This section shall not apply to any county having a population of not less than eight
hundred ninety-seven thousand four hundred (897,400) nor more than eight hundred nine-
ty-seven thousand five hundred (897,500), according to the 2000 federal census or any
subsequent federal census.

HISTORY: Code 1858, § 817; Shan., § 1144; mod. Code 1932, § 1904; modified; Acts
1978, ch. 934, 88 15, 24; 1979, ch. 16, 8 1; T.C.A. (orig. ed.), 8 5-512; Acts 2008, ch.
871, 8 3; 2009, ch. 14, 88 1, 2.



NOTICE

In accordance with the authority vested in me by Tennessee Code Annotated § 5-5-111,
notice is hereby given that the County Legislative Body of Blount County will meet on Thursday,
April 17, 2014 at 7:00 PM at the Blount County Courthouse in Maryville to fill the vacancy in the
office of District 8 Seat B County Commissioner caused by the death of Gordon Wright, Sr.
Before the county legislative body votes or considers any motion or resolution regarding the
office to be filled, the chair shall allow registered voters of the county an opportunity to submit
names to the county legislative body for consideration. The hames may be submitted in writing
to the chair prior to the meeting or may be submitted in person at the meeting. In order for a
name to be considered, a member of the county legislative body must subsequently nominate
the person. Members of the county legislative body may also nominate a candidate or
candidates to fill the office or vacancy without the name being submitted by a voter.
Nominations do not require a second. If the person nominated is not present at the meeting, the
person making the nomination shall submit a signed statement from the nominee that the

nominee is willing to serve in the office if appointed.

Jerome Moon, Chairman
Blount County Legislative Body



	Agenda

	D.1.-Minutes- March 11, 2014

	E.1.a.-Proclamation- April as Child Abuse Prevention and Awareness Month

	E.1.b.-Proclamation Honoring the City of Maryville Fire Department

	E.2.a.-Board of Equalization- Bob Ivens, Larry Campbell, James Wilkerson, David Weaver, and David Caldwell
	E.2.b.-Sheriff'f Merit Board- Harold Coulter

	F.1.-Adopting the Provisions if the 2012 addition of the International Building and Fire Codes and the 2010 ADA Standards 
	G.1.-Budget Transfers

	a.-General County- Accounting- $30,000.00
	b.-General County- Revenue Cleanup- $340,580.00
	c.-General County- Animal Control- $7,289.78

	G.2.-Budget Increases/ Decreases

	a.-General County- Health Department- $2,500.00
	b.-General County- EMA- $6,500.00
	c.-General County- Other General Admin- $5,038.77
	d.-Debt Service- $79,992,996.08
	e.-Debt Service- $130,929.00

	G.3.-Other Budget/ Purchasing Items

	a.-Sale of Surplus Property
	b.-Litter Grant Resolution
	c.-5th Judicial DUI Abatement Grant
	d.-2014-2015 BCSO Alcohol Saturation Patrols Grant
	e.-2014-15 BCSO High Visibility Campaign Grant
	f.-2014-15 Motorcycle/Motorist Safety - The Dragon Grant
	g.-2014-15 BCSO Network Coordinator Grant

	G.4.-Procedures for Placing Portraits of Deceased County Commissioners in the Commission Room

	G.5.-Appointment to Fill the County Commission Vancancy- District 8- Seat B - (No Nominations at Agenda Committee)
	G.6.-Regarding Traffic Patterns at the Intersection of Freels Road and Old Grey Ridge Road




